Opening Date: Wednesday, December 22, 2010

Purchasing Department

Bid #010-091, Amminution for the Sheriff's Training Academy

Precision Delta Corp

Barney's Police

Grace Ammo, LLC

GT Distributors

Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.

Supplies
QTY in Brand/
Item L Cost per Rnd/Total Cost | Cost per Rnd/Total Cost| Cost per Rnd/Total Cost Cost per Rnd/ Total Cost Cost per Rnd/Total Cost
Rounds Description
.40 cal Duty Speer Gold
10,000 | Ammo/10,000| Dot/.40 SW, NO BID
rounds 180GDHP ¢ 0329 |¢ 3,290.00 | $0.31|¢ 3,100.00 0.3618 3,618.00 |$ 030208|$  3,020.80
.40 cal
Practice Speer Lawman
60,000
Ammo/60,000 .40 SW 180 GR
s e $ 0.197|¢$ 11,820.00| $ 0.23 | $ 13,800.00 0.206 | $ 12,360.00 0.2228 13,368.00 | $ 0.22176 | $ 13,305.60
Speer Gold
5000 | OMMDUWY | 5o104 6
! Ammo/5,000
GDHP $ 0291]¢% 145500|$ 030]|$ 1,500.00 0.273 | $ 1,365.00 0.3306 1,653.00 [ $ 020922 |$  1,496.10
15,000 9mm Duty | Speer Lawman
Ammo/15,000| 124 GR TMJ
$ 0.163|$ 2445.00]¢$ 0.23|$ 3,450.00 0.175|$ 2,625.00 0.1694 2,541.00 | $ 0.22812 | $ 3,421.80
223 Cal Speer Lawman
35,000 Practice p 55 Gr
Ammo $ 0331]¢ 11,585.00]|$ 0.28|$ 9,800.00 0.275|$ 9,625.00 0.2894 10,129.00 0.273.19 $ 9,961.65
Federal 69 Gr
5,000 .2zi§12uty Gold Match
BHTP
$ 0568|¢$ 2,840.00|$ 048|$ 2,400.00 0.415|$ 2,075.00 0.6708 3,354.00 | $ 0.50000 | $ 2,500.00
Federal
12GA/5,000 Cartridge Le
>,000 rounds Tactical 12 Ga NO BID
Rifle Slut | ¢ 0404 [ s 202000 040|$ 2,000.00 0.4268 2,134.00 | $ 038947 |$  1,947.35




Precision Delta Corp Bar;::;:l;t;llce Grace Ammo, LLC GT Distributors Bailey's House of Guns, Inc.
QTY in Brand/
Item L Cost per Rnd/Total Cost | Cost per Rnd/Total Cost| Cost per Rnd/Total Cost Cost per Rnd/ Total Cost Cost per Rnd/Total Cost
Rounds Description
Federal
5,000 12%’ 200 | Cartridge 12 NO BID
Ga 00 Buck
$ 0346 |$ 1,730.00 $ 1,950.00 $ 03644 | $ 1,822.00 | $ 0.39473 | $ 1,973.65
.38 Cal Speer Gold Dot
1000 Duty/1,000 125Gr +P NO BID NO BID NO BID
rounds GDHP $ 0.341]$  341.00 $ 0.3306 | $ 330.00
Total Cost for all Ammo $ 37,526.00| $ 38,000.00| $ 28,050.00] $ 38,949.60| $ 37,226.95
**NOTE--------

Please review Brand/Description and Items on all Vendors as some are different as requested to make sure it is the equivalent or better

Approved by Signature

Approved by (print)

Sheriff's Department

Department

Date

Remarks:

1b1/12/2011



