
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

OFFICE

SPECTRUM 
IMAGING 
SYSTEMS EL PASO TIAD 

ELECTRONIC 
RISKS 

CONSULTANT 
SUN CITY 

COPY

YEARLY COST YEARLY COST YEARLY COST YEARLY COST 
AIRPORT NO BID $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

COURT SERVICES $1,729.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

DOWNTOWN $1,189.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

EASTSIDE NO BID $810.00 $990.00 $585.00
FISCAL $1,279.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

HR $1,189.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

INTERSTATE 
COMPACT $849.00 $432.00 $528.00 $325.00

IPP $1,189.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00
IPP $1,189.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

NORTHEAST NO BID $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

PR BOND JAIL NO BID $648.00 $792.00 $468.00
PTD $1,979.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00

TAIP (KS) NO BID $432.00 $528.00 $325.00

TAIP (KS) $1,979.00 $810.00 $990.00 $585.00
TAIP (ADM) $889.00 $648.00 $792.00 $468.00

TAIP (YS) NO BID $432.00 $528.00 $325.00

Adult Probation
Department Approved By (Print)

Signature Date

Opening Date: Tuesday, February 13, 2007

Bid # 07-008, Maintenance Contracts for Copiers for Adult Probation 


