Purchasing Department
Bid #07-028, Amminution for the Region VIII Sheriff's Academy
Opening Date: Tuesday, April 10, 2007

Precision Delta Corp

The Hunting Shack, Inc.

GT Distributors, Inc.

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description Unit Price Total Price | Unit Price |Total Price Unit Price |Total Price
50 cs CCI-3477 |.40 Practice Ammunition CCI Cleanfire / .40 SW, 180 Gr. $ 162.70 | $ 8,135.00 | $ 190.00 | $ 9,500.00 | $ 14327 | $ 7,163.50
40 cs CCI-3460 |9mm Practice Ammunition CCI Blazer Cleanfire / 9mm, 124 Gr. | $ 15950 | $ 6,380.00 | $ 169.00| $ 6,760.00 | $ 134.77 | $ 5,390.80
5jars | FC-AE38K |Practice Ammunition American Eagle /.38 Cal., 130 Gr. | $ 196.00 | $ 980.00 No Bid No Bid $ 15848 | $ 792.40
10 ¢s |PBT-PC3-P375PepperBall Ammunition PepperBall / Purple-Talc No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25490 $ 2,549.00
5c¢s 5307010 |Simunitions Rounds Simunition / 9mm - Yellow No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5cs 5303700 [Simunitions Rounds Simunition / 9mm - Blue No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description DUer;;TOIZr(i)ce Total Price DL;r;rolz)r(i)ce Total Price DUer;Z(O%r(i)ce Total Price
6 cs 83286 .223 Remington / 500 per cs Hornady / 60 Gr. Tap FPD $ 564.50 [ $ 1,693.50 |$ 550.00 | $ 1,650.00|$ 506.00 | $ 1,518.00
2¢cs FC-LE223T |.223 Tactical Load / 500 cs Federal / 55 Gr. LE Tactical No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid $ 949.10 | $ 949.10
30¢cs | FC-AE223 |.223 Practice Ammo /500 cs Federal / 55 Gr FMJ No Bid No Bid $ 22999 | $ 3,449.85( $ 25224 | $ 3,783.60
5¢cs FC-LE308T |.308 Ammo /200 cs Federal / 165 Gr. Tac Load No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,107.85| $ 1,107.85
5c¢s | FC-GM308M |[.308 Match Ammo / 200 cs Federal / Match 168 Gr. BT HP No Bid No Bid $ 54999 | $ 54999 |$ 640.85| $ 640.85
20 cs CCI-3477 |.40 Practice Ammo 1000 cs CCI Cleanfire / .40 SW, 180 Gr. $ 162.70 | $ 3,254.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 3,700.00 | $ 14327 | $ 2,865.40
6cs CCI-3460 |9mm Practice Ammo 1000 cs | CCI Blazer Cleanfire / 9mm, 124 Gr. | $ 159.20 | $ 95520 | $ 169.00 | $ 1,014.00 | $ 134.77 | $ 808.62

**Please note changes that vendors have made on specifications. Total $ 21,397.70 | Total $ 26,623.84 | Total $ 27,569.12

*Part number & description

Approved by (Signature)

Sheriff's Office

Department

Remarks:

Approved by (print)

Date

Ib 050907




