
Description Remarks Quantity Unit Price  Total   Unit Price  Total   Unit 
Price   Total  

Hand Rails - Metal  4' x 3' x 1/2" square 
Tubing Each 2

Bath Exhaust Fan 110Cfm 4 49.99$          199.96$       

Electrical Cover Outlet Plate[Duplex]white Each 67 0.69$            46.23$         

Electrical Togle Switch Cover Plate.white Each 21 0.59$            12.39$         

Electrical Togle Switch With Cover Plate.white Each 57 1.19$            67.83$         
Electrical Outlet [Duplex] With Cover 
Plate.white Each 91 1.19$            108.29$       
Exterior Light Fixtures Standard Base one 
Bulb Each 17

GFI Electrical Outlet.white Each 20 12.79$          255.80$       
Lighting (2 Light) Ceiling Fixture Polished 
Brass Flush Mount Each 55 24.99$          1,374.45$    

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid

Bid # 07-048 (Re-bid) Texas Bootstrap

Purchasing Department

No Bid

No Bid

Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Bid Opening Tuesday, May 08, 2007

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid



Description Remarks Quantity Unit Price  Total   Unit Price  Total   Unit 
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Hampton 4 Blade 3-Speed reversible Motor-
Hugger Design For Low Ceilings-White-Polish 
Brass Each 10

Lighting Troffers Flourscent 4' (4 Lights) Each 8 39.99$          319.92$       

Telephone Jack.white Each 16 1.69$            27.04$         

Concrete  x Yard 3500psi 96
 3/4" $ 67.00 

1" $ 65.00  $6432 $6240 
Anchor Bolt-Fasten Frames to Foundation 
Structures 1/2"x6" Each 142 0.49$            69.58$         

Iron Re-bar #4 LF 1564 5.00$            7,820.00$     0.24$            375.36$       

Sand x Ton Ton 25 12.00$          300.00$        

Screening-Type of Dirt Needed Ton 90 6.75$            607.50$        

Wire Mesh 6"x6" -1010 Concrete [5'x150'] Roll 9 82.00$          738.00$        79.99$          239.97$       

1/2"x4"x8" Drywall Sheet 1093 7.79$            8,514.47$    

1/2"x4"x8"Green Drywall Sheet 102 8.99$            916.98$       

1-1/4" Drywall Screw  x Lb. Course 790 34.99$          1,105.68$    

1-1/4" Drywall nail x Lb. Lb. 190 39.99$          1,319.67$    

1-1/4" Roofing Nails xLb Galvanized 560 27.49$          604.78$       

#15 Degree Felt Roll 33 14.99$          494.67$       No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

4'x8'x1/2" Soffit Sheet 18

1/2" Waffer-Board Clips Each 390 0.08$            31.20$         

4'x8'x1/2" Waffer-Board Sheet 147 6.99$            1,027.53$    

8"Fasia LF 1130

Base Moulding 2 1/4" x LF finger Joint LF 6000 0.49$            2,940.00$    

Closet Door 24" x 80" Each 3

Closet Door 30" x 80" Each 7

Closet Door Bifold 48" x 80" Each 3

Closet Door Sliding 48" x 80" Each 8

Closet Hardware Each 19

Closet Hardware [Passage Set] Each 14

Closet Sliding Door  42" x 80" Each 2

Closet Sliding Door 72" x 80" Each 2

Door Hardware-Exterior [Dead Bolt]-Brass Each 14

Door  Interior Lock -Hardware-Brass Each 30

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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No Bid
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Door Bell [Low Volt] Each 4

Door Interior 28" x 80" Each 1

Door Interior 32" x 80" Each 19

Door Interior 36" x 80" Each 11

Drip Edge [Metal] 2 1/2" LF 1210

Drywall Corner Bead Each 234 0.99$            231.66$       

Drywall Tape {Roll} 250 Ft 19 2.29$            43.51$         

Elestomeric caulk Tube 385 4.72$            1,817.20$    

Elestomeric Finish-Paint 5'Gal 55 51.99$          2,859.45$    

Exterior Sliding Door[Aluminium] 72" x 80" Each 1 379.99$        379.99$       

Exterior Door[Steel Door] 36" X80" 12

Exterior Entry Hardware Door Lock Each 15 14.99$          224.85$       

Exterior Siding w/Texture4'x8'x1/2" Each 154

Furnace Single Sealed 30" x 64 Each 5

Furnace Closet Door 48" x 67" Each 4

Grab Bar For Hand Rail Stainless Steel 1 !/2"x 30" 2

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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No Bid
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No Bid
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Grill Louver Metal 1/4" Square Tubing 3' x 12' 1

Greco Pier (Porch Colume 12" Diamter Each 4

Insulation R-13 Package 125

Insulation R-30 Package 102

Insulation Styrofoam  1/2"x4'x8' Each 65

Joint Compound [25Lb] Bag 600 4.99$            2,994.00$    

Lumber 2"x4"x16' 37 4.99$            184.63$       

Lumber 2"x6"x20' 63 8.99$            566.37$       

Lumber 2"x6"x8' 24 3.99$            95.76$         

Lumber 2''x4"x24' 20

Lumber 2''x4"x8' 1060 2.69$            2,851.40$    

Lumber 2" X 4" X 92 7/16" Each 1300 2.59$            3,367.00$    

Lumber 2''x4" x12' 20 3.99$            79.80$         

Nail   6D x Lb.[Coated] Lb. 135 0.69$            93.15$         

Nail 16D x Lb.[Coated] Lb. 435 0.79$            343.65$       

Nail 16D x  Air Gun Box 7 42.99$          300.93$       

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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No Bid 
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Nail-Headless # 4D-Finish Lb. 137 1.09$            149.33$       

Nails - Concrete 2 1/2" For Anchor of Frame 
Walls Lb. 145 2.19$            317.55$       

Paint - Trim-Semi-Gloss Enamel 5 gallon 27 69.99$          1,889.73$    

Paint Brush 3" Each 26 1.99$            51.74$         

Paint Mineral Thinner 1'Gal 42 4.99$            209.58$       

Paint Primer 5 gallon 10 79.99$          799.90$       

Paint Roll Cover 9" Each 26 1.75$            45.50$         

Paint Roller Frame 9" Each 14 1.49$            20.86$         

Paint-Semi Gloss Interior 5 gallon 62 56.99$          3,533.38$    

Roofing Cement 5 gallon 9 22.99$          206.91$       

Roofing Hurricane Ties 1 1/2" Each 160

Roof Trusses Each 58

Roofing Roll 90% 90% 3

Roofing Shingles {bundle} 3 Tap Bundle 363

Smoke Detector[Battery Operated] Each 37 6.95$            257.15$       

Spackling Interior Paste 1 Qt Can 4 3.99$            15.96$         

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid No Bid
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Stucco Wire Corner  2 1/2" Each 44

Stucco Wire Bead Each 148

Stucco Mesh Roll 15

Unicoat [Bag] 50 Lb 350

Whitewood Boards Ponderosa Pine #2 Grade 1"x2" x 8' 200 1.09$            218.00$       
Window Exterior Double Pane 1' x 2' White-To 
Open Vertical Each 4
Window Exterior Double Pane 3' x 3' White To 
Open Horizontal Each 4
Window Exterior Double Pane 48" x 59" White 
To Open Horizontal Each 1

Window Exterior Double Pane 3' x 4' White To 
Open Horizontal Each 27

Air Register 6"x10" Each 58 8.99$            521.42$       

Evaporator-tem Control - High and Low Each 9

Furnace-Natural Gas 75000BTU 5 479.99$        2,399.95$    

Furnace - Natural Gas 100.000btu 4 499.99$        1,999.96$    

Furnace Closet {Duct and vent work ] Unit 9

Louver Vent 8"x10" Aluminum Each 73 9.99$            729.27$       

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Master cooler Down Draft - 2 Speed Motor 5500cfm 4 189.99$        759.96$       

Master cooler Down Draft - 2 Speed Motor 4500cfm 5 119.99$        599.95$       

Multishutter Wall Register 10" x 10" Each 26 19.99$          519.74$       

Thermostat[low Volt] Each 9 9.99$            89.91$         

13" x 13" Ceramic floor Tile Non-Slip 14Per Box 848

6"Ceramic Wall Tile 40 perbox 28

Color- Sand Grout {Bag} 25 Lb 161

Color-Non Sand Grout (Bag) 10 Lb 4

Thinset -Gray[50Lb] Bag 245 6.19$            1,516.55$    

Tile Mastic[3.5Gal] pail 3

Tile Spacer x Bag 50 each 66

VCT - Glue 3 1/2 Gallon 2

VCT  (Vinyll Compose Tile) Each 380
Kitchen Base Cabinets Door Square Style 
Oak LF 123
Kitchen Cabinet  [Wall] Door Square Style 
Oak LF 137

Kitchen Countertop Laminated LF 123

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Kitchen Exhaust Fan Hood x 30" Each 9 55.00$          495.00$       

Bath Tub [Fiberglass]surround stall 60"x30" 6

Drain plumbing Fittings Set 21 10.20$      214.20$           

Kitchen Faucet-Delta-One Handle Each 8 59.99$          497.92$       

Kitchen Sink[Stainless] 32" x 22" x 8" Each 8 99.99$       799.92$     * $ 69.03 552.24$        
Lavatory Faucet 4" centerset single-
handle - Delta Each 9 45.99$       413.91$     

Lavatory w/Cabinet {24"} Each 1

Lavatory w/Cabinet {30"} Each 5

Lavatory w/Cabinet {36"} Each 3

P Trap PVC  1 1/2" Each 15 3.99$         59.85$       1.36$      20.40$          

P Trap PVC  2" Each 2 9.99$         19.98$       2.31$      4.62$            

Pipe,Valves and Fittings Set 27 * $ 245.11 6,617.97$     

PVC Tail Pipe 1 1/2" Each 15 0.62$      9.30$            

Toilet Bowl &Tank 1.6 gallon white Each 10 89.99$       899.90$     60.00$    600.00$        

Tub/Shower Faucets - Delta -One Handle Each 11 69.99$       769.89$     

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid
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Cemex Riverside Hardware Bilcncieri, Inc.

Water Valve Cut-Off 1/2" x 1/2" 
Compression Each 50 6.99$         349.50$     2.35$      112.50$        
Shower surround Stall + Safety Glass 
Door Each 4

Water Heater [Natural Gas] 40Gal 4 289.99$     1,159.96$  305.62$  1,222.48$     
Water Supply - Laundry 1/2" With Box 
Hot & Cold Insert Into Wall Behind 
Washer Each 3 15.06$    45.18$          

Water Supply x 1/2" 1/2" x 16" Each 38 3.69$         140.22$     0.42$      15.96$          

Approved By (signature) Approved By (print)

Planning & Development

* Pipes valves & Fittings- 11/2" 
pipe 6.06x40 =$242.40, angle 
valve stop $1.63, sink connect 

1/2 x 1/2 x 16 = $1.08 total 
$245.11 *pipe is cell core don’t 

have 11/4" 

No Bid 

 * Kitchen sink 33" x 22" x 8" 
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No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




