Tortilla Bid #07-125 for the County of El Paso-Jail
facilities, Adult Probation (C.R.T.C. & Restitution)
& Juvenile Justice Centers.

Albuquerque Tortilla

BORDER EAGLE

Effective dates: November 1, 2007 thru April 30, 2008 Co. DISTRIBUTOR
Description Commodity#
1.|Corn Tortilla 2802-1000089-82 2.00 pkg 1.15 pkg
6" in diameter (thick) (PACK SIZE) = 80 oz pkg/90 ct 60 ct/pkg
est. usage = 200 pkgs (.0222.. ea) (.0191 ea)
2. |[Flour Tortilla 2802-1000090-28 1.10 dz 1.05 pkg
9" in diameter (PACK SIZE) = 280z pkg 1dz
est. usage = 300 pkg (.0875 ea)
3. [Tostada Chip (Tortilla) 2807-0000092-68 1.05 pkg 4.80/6# pkg
(PACK SIZE) = 32 0z (3/2# pkQ)
(.525 Ib) (.80 1b)
4. [Tamales - red chili (Frozen) 2840-6006992-52
BEEF NO BID 6.00 dz
PORK (PACK SIZE) = 5.50 dz 6.00 dz
(asper needed basis) 48 oz
5. [Tamales - green chili (FROZEN) 2840-6006992-52
Beef NO BID 6.00 dz
Pork NO BID 6.00 dz
Chicken 5.75 dz 6.00 dz
(asper needed basis) 48 oz

! Prepared by Victor Duran




DESCRIPTION COMMODITY# | ALBUQUERQUE BORDER
TORTILLAS EAGLE
Tostada shells pkg 2814-0000092-56 NO BID 1.35 ea
(PACK SIZE) = 24 ct
(asper needed basis) (.0562 ea)
Chicharon pkg 2807-0000091-70 2.15/bag 1.35/bag
5 0z bag (PACK SIZE) = 5 0z/bg 5 0z/bg
***Bid will be awarded to overall low bidder Complete bid
TOTAL=|[ Incomplete Bid Awarded




