

Tortilla Bid #08-024 for the County of El Paso-Jail facilities, Adult Probation (C.R.T.C. & Restitution) and Juvenile Justice Centers. Effective dates: May 1, 2008 thru October 31, 2008			Albuquerque Tortilla Co.	BORDER EAGLE DISTRIBUTOR	Shamrock Foods
	Description	Commodity#			
1.	Corn Tortilla	2802-1000089-82	16.49 pkg	1.15 pkg	14.84
	6" in diameter (thick)	(PACK SIZE) =	6/120 ct	60 ct	6/90 pk
	est. usage = 200 pkgs.		+ (.02290 ea)	+ (.0191 ea)	+ (.02748 ea)
2.	Flour Tortilla	2802-1000090-28	22.90	1.05 dz	18.61
	9" in diameter	(PACK SIZE) =	15/10 ct	1 dz	12 dz
	est. usage = 300 pkg.		+ (1.83192 /12 ct)	+ (1.05 dz/pkg)	+ (1.5508 dz/pkg)
3.	Tostada Chip (Tortilla)	2807-0000092-68	12.18 cs	4.80 cs	15.86 cs
		(PACK SIZE) =	6/2#	3/2#/cs	6/2#
			+ (1.015 lb)	+ (.80 lb)	+ (1.3216 lb)
4.	Tamales - red chili (Frozen)	2840-6006992-52			
	BEEF		No bid	6.26 dz + (.521 ea)	34.44-60/4 oz (.574 ea)
	PORK	(PACK SIZE) =	27.50-60 ct. + (.458 ea)	6.26 dz + (.521 ea)	27.43-60/3 oz + (.457 ea)
	(as per needed basis)				
5.	Tamales - green chili (FROZEN)	2840-6006992-52			
	Beef		No bid	6.26 dz (.521 ea)	No bid
	Pork		No bid	6.26 dz (.521 ea)	No bid
	Chicken		28.50-60 ct + (.475 ea)	6.26 dz (.521 ea)	31.96-60/3 oz + (.5326 ea)
	(as per needed basis)				

	DESCRIPTION	COMMODITY#	ALBUQUERQUE	BORDER	SHAMROCK
			TORTILLAS	EAGLE	FOODS
6.	Tostada shells pkg.	2814-0000092-56	No Bid	1.35 pkg	12.78
		(PACK SIZE) =		24 ct	200 ct
	(as per needed basis)			+ (.0562 ea)	+ (.0639 ea)
7.	Chicharon pkg.	2807-0000091-70	18.29	1.35 pkg	No bid
	5 oz bag	(PACK SIZE) =	10/5 oz	5 oz bag	
			+ (1.829 bag)	+ (1.35 bag)	
<b>TOTAL=</b>			5.63182 total	<b>5.8803 total</b>	4.52738 total
<b>***Bid awarded as lump sum to overall low bidder</b>			(Incomplete price-out bid)	<b>(Complete price-out bid)</b>	(Incomplete price-out bid)
<b>(Complete price-out)</b>				<b>Awarded</b>	

---

<sup>i</sup> Prepared by Victor Duran

Dept signature: