
Vendors Video Recording System  
Overhead/Modular/Install

MCT & Mounting 
Systems/Install Partitions/Install Push Bumpers/Install

 No Bid           
Modular/Install 

$4,750.00/$150.00       
Software $300.00         

S&H $38.00               
Total Cost $5,238.80       

NO BID

NO BID

Overhead/Install     
$5,450.58/$367.50        

Total Cost $5,818.08

Modular/Install  
$5,767.77/$367.00        

Total Cost$ 6,134.77

Overhead/Install  
$4,900.00/$135.00        

Total Cost $5,035.00

Modular/Install 
$5,175.00/$101.00        

Total Cost$ 5,276.00

Overhead/Install  
$4,904.00/$435.00       

Total Cost $5,339.00

Modular/Install  
$5,170.00/$435.00        

Total Cost$ 5,315.00

Purchasing Department
 BID # 08-092, Equipment for the (9) Constable Vehicles 

OPENING DATE: Wednesday, July 16, 2008

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$191.66/$78.75    
Total Cost $ 270.41

$270.00/$67.50      
Total Cost $337.50

No Bid

John Wright 
Associates, Inc.

No Bid $6,068.73/No Install

$478.10/$99.75 
Total Cost$ 577.85

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$7009.17/$367.50    
Total Cost $7,376.67

No Bid

$537.22/$112.50     
Total Cost $649.72

No Bid

M/A Com Radios/Install

*ICOP Digital No Bid

R.T.C., Inc.

$2,592.68/$262.50   
Total Cost $2,855.18

Alamo Auto 
Supply

$3481.13/$65.00      
Total Cost $3546.13    

(Alternate radio      
Motorola XTL2500)

GSA Only, LLC



NO BID

NO BID

LB 07/22/08

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$6,019.00/$549.00 
Total Cost $6568.00

No Bid

Date

**Does not meet spec's/No Buit-in HDD or DVD-Video Recorder                                                            

Approved By (print)

No Bid

**Portable 
Computer 

Systems,  Inc.
No Bid

Overhead Modular         
(one system)              

$4,690.00                

Dailey and Wells $2,438.67/No Install

*Does not meet Spec's/No Built-In DVD-Video Recorder

Constables
Department

Approved By (signature)


