Purchasing Department

Bid #07-028, Amminution for the Region VIII Sheriff's Academy

Opening Date: Tuesday, April 10, 2007

*Precision Delta Corp

Lawman's Shooters Supply

**GT Distributors, Inc.

Part #

QTY Item Brand/Description Total Price Total Price Total Price
.40 Practice Speer Lawman/ .40 SW, 180 .
30cs | CCI-53652 Ammunition Gr. $6,600.00 | different prt # | nq ig a. $6,48.00 | b.$714.00
9mm Practice CCI Super Lawman/ 9mm, .
25¢cs CCI-53651 Ammunition 124 Gr. $4,375.00 different prt # No Bid $4,770.00
.223 cal Practice
30cs | FC-AE223N Ammunition Fed/.223 Cal, 62 |\, gjg No Bid a.$5,310.00 |  $4,680.00
5cs 5307010 Simunitions Rounds | Simunition / 9mm - Yellow |No Bid No Bid No Bid
5c¢s 5307010 Simunitions Rounds Simunition / 9mm - Blue  |No Bid No Bid No Bid
. PBT-PC3- PepperBall
5 jars p375 Ammunition PepperBall /Purple-Talc No Bid No Bid $1,349.95
. PBT-PP- PepperBall
5 jars W375 Ammunition PepperBallWater Rounds |, i No Bid $1,349.95
100 rds 3016 12 Ga. 32 cal. Stinger rubber ball rounds |No Bid No Bid $469.00
250 rds 3027 12Ga. Drag stablizing sock rounds No Bid No Bid $ 1,080.00 | See Note
10 1089 Stinger 32 cal. Rubber ball grenade w/OC [\, Bid No Bid $400.90
10 1050 OC/Cs Aerosol Grenade No Bid No Bid $393.80
. Multi port plus gun steel
5 7000 #25 Multi port Body No Bid No Bid $234.40
15 gram distraction device
20 7001 #25, 15 gram reloads No Bid No Bid $475.00
15cs FC-AE223N Ammunition American Eagle No Bid No Bid a. $2,655.00 | b.$2,340.00
Hornady- .223 cal/60 gr. 200 Rd cs
1os 83286 Hornady TAP Hornady TAP No Bid $119.36 $110.90
308 Win/168 gr. )
2¢cs FC-GM308 SBHP Federal Cartridge No Bid No Bid $311.22 [ See Note
10 DEF TEC 40 mm Sponge Impact Rounds No Bid No Bid $215.70
Direct Impact Chemical
10 DEF TEC 40 mm Rounds No Bid No Bid $215.70




*Precision Delta Corp

Lawman's Shooters Supply

**GT Distributors, Inc.

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description Total Price Total Price Total Price
Pyrotechnic Chemical
10 DEF TEC No.2CS Grenades No Bid No Bid $250.00
Pyrotechnic Chemical
10 DEF TEC o/C -CIS Grenades No Bid No Bid $250.00
Pyrotechnic Smoke Pyrotechnic Smoke
5 DEF TEC Grenades Grenades No Bid No Bid $140.65
5 DEF TEC #15 Rubber Ball Grenades C/S No Bid No Bid $199.95
Ferret Tactical O/C Liquid
10 DEF TEC 40 mm Rounds No Bid No Bid $187.50
75 ALS1208 12 Gage Distraction Device (muzzle )
BoreThunder 9 bang) No Bid $303.75 $455.25
ALS1204 Less Lethal Ammo. "Rubber|
25 Hornets Nest 12 Gage Buckshot" Short Range
9 INo Bid $101.25 No Bid
AL8120.4 Hi Less Lethal Ammo. "Rubber|
25 Velocity 12 Gage Buckshot" Long Range
Hornets Nest 9 9 No Bid $101.25 No Bid
ALSlZOZ. Less Lethal Ammo. Fin
25 Rubber Fin 12 Gage Stabilized Munitions
Rocket No Bid $87.50 $114.25
#15 "Stinger" .
10 DEF TEC Grenade DT 1090 Sting Granade (less lethal) I\ Big No Bid $429.40
#PBT-PC3- | Container Pepperball 375 round containerof
1 - Pepperball Insert Scented
P375 Training Rounds o
Purple Training Rds. No Bid No Bid $269.99
75  (Jail ALS1208 Distraction Device (muzzle
12 Gage .
Annex) | BoreThunder bang) No Bid $340.50 $455.25
ALS1204 Less Lethal Ammo. "Rubber|
25" Hornets Nest 12 Gage Buckshot" Short Range
9€¢  INo Bid $101.25 No Bid
AL8120.4 Hi Less Lethal Ammo. "Rubber|
25" Velocity 12 Gage Buckshot" Long Range
Hornets Nest u 9 9 No Bid $101.25 No Bid
ALSlZOZ. Less Lethal Ammo. Fin
25" Rubber Fin 12 Gage Stabilized Muniti )
Rocket abilized Munitions No Bid $87.50 $114.25
N #15 "Stinger" )
10 DEF TEC Grenade DT 1090 Sting Granade (less lethal) No Bid No Bid $375.00




*Precision Delta Corp

Lawman's Shooters Supply

**GT Distributors, Inc.

QTY Part # Item Brand/Description Total Price Total Price Total Price
N #PBT-PC3- | Container Pepperball 875 round containerof
1 P375 Training Rounds Pepperball Insert Scented )
9 Purple Training Rds. No Bid No Bid $269.99
N #PBT-PC3- | Container Pepperball 875 round containerof
2 P375 Training Rounds Pepperball Insert Scented
9 Purple Training Rds. No Bid No Bid $539.98
N #PBT-PC3- | Container Pepperball 375 round contalner. O.f
2 P375 Training Rounds Pepperball Water Training
9 Rds. No Bid No Bid $539.98
* Please note different Part numbers

**Offered 2 prices for certain ammo- Different Part numbers and notes some items have been discontinued
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