"Tortilla Bid #08-156 for the County of El Paso-Jail facilities, Adult
Probation (C.R.T.C. & Restitution)

and Juvenile Justice Centers. ISABELLA BORDER EAGLE | cHACHEWALKA |EL ZACATECANO
Effective dates: Nov. 1, 2008 thru April 30, 2009 FOODS, INC. DIST., INC.
Description Commodity#
2.99 pkg. 1.10 pkg.
. |Corn Tortilla 2802-1000089-82 P Pg 2.89 pkg.
80 ct. 60 ct
6" in diameter (thick) (PACK SIZE) = 80 ct.
(.037 ea.) (.018 ea)
est. usage = 800 pkgs (.036 ea.)
1.77 pkg. 1.00 pkg.
. |[Flour Tortilla 2802-1000090-28 P PKg 1.69 pkg. 2.25 pkg.
- 1dz. 1dz.
9" in diameter (PACK SIZE) = 1 dz. 1dz
.1475 ea. .083 ea.
est. usage = 1755 pkg ( ) ( ) (.1408 ea) (.1875 ea.)
7.26 pkg. 4.80 pkg.
. |[Tostada Chip (Tortilla) 2807-0000092-68 P -
3/2# 3/2#
(PACK SIZE) =
1.211b .80 Ib
Est. usage = 2300 pkg ( ) ( )
. [Tamales - red chili (Frozen) 2840-6006992-52
No bid 6.26 dz.
BEEF 8.50 dz.
7.90 dz. 6.26 dz.
PORK (PACK SIZE) = 8.50 dz.
(asper needed basis)
. [Tamales - green chili (FROZEN) 2840-6006992-52
No bid 6.26 dz.
Beef 8.50 dz.
No bid 6.26 dz.
Pork 8.50 dz.
7.90 dz. 6.26 dz.
Chicken z ‘ 8.50 dz.

(asper needed basis)




DESCRIPTION COMMODITY# ISABELLA BORDER CHACHE WALKA | EL ZACATECANO
FOODS EAGLE
6. Tostada shells pkg 2814-0000092-56 14.50 pkg. 1.35 pkg.
(PACK SIZE) = 200 ct. 24 ct.
(asper needed basis) (0725 ea) (.056 ea)
7. Chicharon pkg 2807-0000091-70 No bid 1.35 pkg.
5 0z bag (PACK SIZE) = 4.5 0z pkg.
Est. usage 204 pkg
TOTAL= 17.267 34.901 .1768 42.6875
***Bid awarded as lump sum to overall low bidder Incomplete Complete Incomplete Incomplete
(Complete price-out) Awarded

" Prepared by Victor Duran

Dept signature:



