
Description QTY

RyneCorp SunCity
Desert 

Communication Toshiba Checkpoint Ikon
Scanner DR-4010C 8 21,592.00$  19,000.00$  18,080.00$    18,816.00$  21,247.92$      16,568.67$    
Scanner Fujitsu Scan Snap s510 7 3,283.00$    3,220.00$    2,072.00$     2,142.00$    2,771.30$        2,973.25$      
HP Office Jet Pro l76xx All-In-One 5 no bid 1,940.00$    2,155.00$     2,050.00$    2,155.00$        2,073.00$      
Hp Color Laser Jet CP3525DN 1 no bid no bid 815.00$        975.00$       815.00$           887.45$         
HP LaserJet P2035n 1 no bid no bid 271.00$        234.00$       271.00$           295.31$         
HP Laser Jet P3005x 10 no bid 9,240.00$    10,320.00$    10,670.00$  10,320.00$      9,717.20$      
HP Laser Jet P4015x 14 no bid 24,738.00$  24,570.00$    26,250.00$  26,012.00$      28,793.28$    
Dell 5000 San Switch 16 Ports 1 no bid no bid no bid no bid 18,129.00$      no bid

Total 24,875.00$  58,138.00$  58,283.00$    61,137.00$  81,721.22$      61,308.16$    

Approved By (signature)

Information Technology Departmen
Department

Recommendation:

Date

Purchasing Department
Bid # 09-042 Scanners and Printers for Information Technology Department

Opening Date: Thursday,  June 11, 2009

Vendors

Approved by (Print)
Art Armas, Director Information Technology


