Milk bid#10-015 for the County of El Paso-Sheriff Jail Facilities (Downtown & Annex),
Adult Probation (C.R.T.C. & Restitution) & Juvenile Justice Center

Il Effective Dates: May 1, 2010 thru October 31, 2010

(Est. usage for a six month period & it can change depending on the population within the facilities)

DESCRIPTION Shamrock PRICE'S Distl:i%rfting Extend(-?‘d Pricing |
Foods CREAMERIES LLC. Shamrock Price’s Fore Dist.

. |Low - Fat Milk, 5 gal. Pk. No 14.61 12.86 2629.80 1929.00
Commodity#2810-700000Y-05 Size = Bid 5 gal 6 gal No Bid (17.532 x 150)) (12.86 x 150)
(est. usage 150 ea) (if by 6 gal) (6 gal)
Milk, whole. 5 gal Pk. 19.13 15.81 12.86 573.90 474.30 321.50
Commodity#2810-900000Y-05 Size = 5 gal 5 gal 6 gal (22.956 x 25) (18.972 x 25) (12.86 x 25)
(est. usage 25 ea) (if by 6 gal) (if by 6 gal) (6 gal)
Homo Milk, ¥ pint. Pk. 21.20 2197 ea 1925 ea 318000.00 230685.00 202125.00
Commodity#2810-9000005-Y4 Size = 70 ct 50 ct 70 ct (21.20 x 15000) | (15.379 x 15000) |(13.475 x 15000)
(est. usage 15,000 cs) 70 ct (if by 70 ct) (70 ct)

. [Skim Milk, 1/2 pint Pk. 19.69 .1823 ea 1511 ea 1969.00 1276.10 1057.70
Commodity#2810-8000005-Y4 Size = 70 ct 50 ct 70 ct. (19.69 x 100) (if by 70 ct) (10.577 x 100)
(est. usage 100 cs) (70 ct) (70 ct)

. _[Cottage Cheese, reg./lo-fat. 5# Pk. 18.04 4.35 ea 7.20 ea 795 ea
Commodity#2809-400000Y-05 Size = 2/5# 2/3# 5/5# 9.02 ea (if by 5#) 7.20 ea
(asper needed basis) (5#%) (5#) (5#)

. [Cottage Cheese, reg./lo-fat. 24 0z | pg. 17.10 2.24 ea 1.99 ea 461.70 403.20 358.20
Commodity#2809-400000Y-05 Size = 2/5# 6/24 0z 12/24 0z | (2.565 x 180 ea) (2.24 x 180) (1.99 x 180)
(Est. usage 180 ea) (if by 24 0z) 24 0z 24 0z




Extended pricing

DESCRIPTION Shamrock CREiII\(/I:EERSiES Fore Dist. Shamrock Price’s Fore Dist.

7. [Sour Cream —reg./ & lo-fat. 5# PK. 11.24 3.22 ea 4.99 ea 5.3666 ea
Commodity#2811-000000Y-05 Size = 2/5# 2/3# 6/5# 5.62 ea (if by 5#) 4.99 ea
(asper needed basis) (reg. only) 5# 5# 5#

8. |Sour Cream, reg. & lite. 1# Pk . No 1.13 ea 1.52 ea

Commodity#2811-000000Y-05 Size = Bid 12/16 oz 24/1# No Bid 1.13 ea 1.52 ea
(asper needed basis) 16 oz 1#

9. |Yoqurt. 8 0z. (Assorted flavors) Pk. No 42 ea .59 ea 56 ea
Commodity#2811-10000Y1-00 Size = Bid 12/6 oz 15/cs No Bid (if by 8 02) 59 ea
(asper needed basis) 8 oz 80z

10. [Milk Chocolate. ¥ pint Pk . 20.55 .2085 ea .1824 ea 4110.00 2919.00 2553.60
Commodity#2810-30000Y1-05 Size = 70 ct 50 ct 70 ct (20.55 x 200 cs) [(14.595 x 200 cs) [(12.768 x 200 cs)
(est. usage 200 cs) (if by 70 ct) (70 ct)

11. Milk, 1 % (low-fat). ¥ pint Pk. 19.95 .1940 ea .1750 ea 3990.00 2716.00 2450.00
Commodity#2810-7000005-Y4 Size = 70 ct 50 ct 70 ct (19.95x200cs) | (13.58 x 200) (12.25 x 200)
(est usage 200 cs) (if by 70 ct) (70 ct)

12. |[Fruit Drink.(Assorted flavors) pt. Pk. No .1550 ea .1780 ea 271.25 311.50
Commodity#2810-20000Y4-96 Size = Bid 50 ct 70 ct No Bid (10.85x 25 cs) | (12.46 x 25 cs)
(est usage 25 cs) (if by 70 ct) (70 ct)




Extended pricing

DESCRIPTION Shamrock CRII:—Z’I,:‘}\II\SI:ERSIES Fore Dist. Shamrock Price’s Fore Dist.

13. |Orange Juice. ¥ pint Pk. 31.06 .2351 ea .1780 ea 3106.00 1645.70 1246.00

Commodity#2804-7000093-20 Size = 70 ct 50 ct 70 ct (31.06 x 100 cs) | (16.457 x 100) (12.46 x 100)

(est uasge 100 cs) 70 ct 70 ct
14. |Orange juice (pure). 4 oz Pk . 9.42 22.12 cs. .1450 ea 12.9188

Commodity#2804-7000093-70 Size = 70 ct 96 ct 96/cs (if by 96 ct) 22.12 ea 13.92

(asper needed basis) 96 ct 96 ct 96 ct
15. |Low-fat milk. 1 gal PK. 16.16 2.63 ea 2.30 ea

Commodity#2810-80000Y7-77 Size = 6/1 gal 4/1 gal 6/cs 2.6933 ea 2.63 ea 2.30 ea

(asper needed basis) Gal Gal Gal
16. |Milk, whole. 1 gal Pk . 17.84 3.04 ea 2.50 ea

Commodity#2810-900000Y-01 Size = 6/1 gal 4/1 gal 6/cs 2.9733 ea 3.04 ea 2.50 ea

(asper needed basis) Gal Gal Gal
17. |Buttermilk. %2 gal Pk. 7.05 1.60 ea 1.40 ea

Commodity#2810-20000Y4-96 Size = 2/.5 gal 9/.5 gal 12/cs 3.525 ea 1.60 ea 1.40 ea

(asper needed basis) .5 gal .5 gal .5 gal
18. [Egg Nog. QT Pk. No 1.55 ea 1.60 ea

Commodity#2809-900000Y-01 Size = Bid 12/qt 6/cs No Bid 155 ea 1.60 ea

(asper needed basis) Qt Qt
19. |Ice cream. (Assorted) 3 gal. Pk. 11.71 16.79 19.25

Commodity#2810-1000089-60 Size = 3 gal 3 gal 3 gal 11.71 ea 16.79 ea 19.25 ea

(asper needed basis) 3 Gal 3 gal 3gal




PRICE'S

DESCRIPTION Shamrock |CREAMERIES| Fore Dist. Extended Pricing
Shamrock Price’s Fore Dist.
20. |Sherbert. 3 gal. (Vrty. Flavors) Pk. 9.81 10.89 16.01
Commodity#2810-1000089-60 Size = 3 gal 3 gal 3 gal 9.81 ae 10.89 ae 16.01 ea
(as per needed basis) 3 gal 3 gal 3 gal
21. Dixie Cups. 3 0z Pk. 6.03 2.32/cs. 3.69
Commodity#2810-1000092-80 Size = 24 pk. 6/dz. DZ. 3.015 dz. 2.32 dz. 3.69 dz
(as per needed basis) DZ. DZ. DZ.
16.58, 14.95,
22. Assorted ice cream novelties. 24| pk. |12.39 &6.70 12.00 11.75 12.655 ea
Commodity#2810-1000092-80 Size = 24 pk 24 ct 24 ct. (Avg. sum) 12.00 ae 11.75 ea
(as per needed basis) 24 ct 24 ct 24 ct
*** BID WILL BE AWARDED TO OVERALL-LOW BIDDER ** Incomplete bid AWARDED
Total = $333361.8404 $243107.5966 $212439.22

* DARKER SHADE = AWARDED VENDOR
** Incomplete Bid-out by Shamrock Foods




