
Tranum Country Ford

Dailey & Wells 

Casa Ford Inc.

Alamo Industries, Inc.

** Recommends to add Cool Guard System(not spec'd) $675.00/Truck

2010/Ford F150 Supercrew 

4X2 /$55,959.00 ea

 NO BID ON VEHICLE                            

submitted for Item O. Mobile 

Radios/w installations  each 

$2,679.25   ---  Dept requested Trucks 

with equipment already installed.   

Purchasing Department
  Bid #10-053, Two Trucks(Sp Ops) and Two Vehicles(warrant) w/Interior & Exterior Equipment 

Opening Date: Wednesday, August 11, 2010 

Vendors 

Two Canine Trucks w/installed 

interior & exterior equipment (Sp 

Ops)

Year/Make/Model/Cost

 Approved by (signature) & Date 

 Sheriff Departmet (Sp Ops) 

Department

 NO BID  

 **2010/Ford F150 

Supercrew/$52,686.55 ea 



 Dailey & Wells  Casa Ford Inc. Tranum Country Ford Alamo Industries, Inc.

 No BID 
 ***2011/Ford Crown Vic. 

Interceptor/$22,638.39 ea 

 2011Ford Crown Vic 

Inter                                       

$ 23,717.00 ea 

 No BID 

 Dailey & Wells  Casa Ford Inc. Tranum Country Ford Alamo Industries, Inc.

 No BID $745.00 ea $745.00 ea $745.00 ea

 No BID $175.00 ea $175.00 ea $175.00 ea

 No BID $65.00 ea $65.00 ea $65.00 ea

 No BID $90.00 ea $90.00 ea $90.00 ea

$2679.25 ea $2,650.00 ea $2,950.00 ea $2,650.00 ea

LB 8/16/10

Approved By (signature)

Department

 Vendors 

Sheriff's Department (Warrants)

Approved By (print)

Interior & Exterior Equipment for 

Two Vehicles for Warrants(above)                                                      

Sheriff's Motorpool will Install                         

Date

Item E. Mobile Radio

Item A. Prisoner barrier Security Screen

Item B. Go Rhino Grill  Guard

Item C. Fire Extinguisher-refillable with 

mounting bracket

Item D. Batteriy Protection Unit

Two Vehicles (warrants)                                 

No equipment installed               

(Year/Make/Model/Cost)                  

***Standard El Paso County Sheriff Colors (two toned) - Add $743,00 each


