Bid #13-041
Paper and Envelope Products for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: July 17, 2013

Business Form Inc.

Landa Packaging

Office Depot

Olmsted Kirk Paper Co.

Spectrum Paper

El Paso TX Dist. LLC. Boca Raton FL Dallas TX Co., Inc.
El Paso TX El Paso TX
Item Monthly Local Factor Local Factor
Description Price Per Case Price Per Case Price Per Case Price Per C Price Per Case
No. criptt Estimated Usage ! ! ! Added rice rertase Added rie
1 8% x11 Paper Bond White Letter Size 20# 5,000 sheets per case 2400 CS. $28.88 $26.02 $27.49 $28.31 $26.05 $26.83 $26.10
2 |8% x 14 Paper Bond White Legal Size 20#, 5,000 sheets per case 500 CS. $43.88 $37.34 $52.49 $54.06 $42.65 $43.93 $36.10
3 |11 x 17 Paper Bond White 20#, 2,500 sheets per case 50 CS. $36.88 $28.24 $43.13 $44.42 $33.50 $34.51 $28.38
4 |8 x 11 Letter Size 25% Cotton Paper, 4,000 sheets per case 200 CS. No Bid No Bid $24.87 $25.62 $101.00 $104.03 $108.13
4 (a) [Correct Price for: 8 %x11 Letter Size 25% Cotton Paper, 5000 sheets per case $248.70 $256.16
5 Z-Pal.'t Carbonless 20#, 8 % x 11, Reverse Sequence (Canary/White), NCR, 80 C. No Bid No Bid 5201.99 $208.05 565.60 567.57 561.43
Imation or equal
6 3-Pa|.'t Carbonless 20#, 8 % x 11, Reverse Sequence (Pink/Canary/White), NCR, 80 C. No Bid No Bid 5215.99 5222.47 $73.85 576.07 569.18
Imation or equal
4-Part Carbonless 20#,8 % x 11, Reverse Sequence (Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/ . .
7 White), NCR, Imation or equal 80 CS. No Bid No Bid $243.99 $251.31 $78.85 $81.22 $73.95
5-Part Carbonless, 20#, 8.5x11, Reverse . . . .
8 Sequence(Green/Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/White), NCR, Imation or equal 80 Cs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $81.10 $83.53 $76.13
9 I2-Palrt Carbonless, 204, 8.5x11, Straight Sequence (Canary/White), NCR, 50 CS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.60 $67.57 561.43
mation or equal
10 I3-Palrt Carbonless, 20#, 8.5x11, Straight Sequence (Pink/Canary/White), NCR, 50 CS. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 569.18
mation or equal
4-PartCarbonless, 20#, 8.5 x 11, Straight Sequence . . . . . .
11 (Goldenrod/Pink/Canary/White), NCR, Imation or equal 50 Cs. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $73.95
12 |#10 Envelope 24# Window, White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per case 600 BX. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.26
13 |#10 Envelope 24# Regular Plain, White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per case 600 BX. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.90
14 |#9 Envelope 24# Window, White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per case 300 BX. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.26
15 |#9 Envelope 24# Regular Plain, White, 500/box, 2500 envelopes per case 300 BX. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.90
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