
Inmate Clothing, Bedding Linen for the 

County of El Paso Sheriff's Department 

Opening Date: September 23, 2013

ACME Supply Co., 

LTD 

Glen Cove, NY

Bob Barker Company, 

Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC

California Prison 

Industry Authority 

Folsom, CA

Charm-Tex 

Brooklyn, NY

Gold Water 

Industries, Inc. 

Gardena, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 

Inc. Waco, TX

Poltex International 

Inc. McDonough, GA

Robinson 

Textiles 

Gardena, CA

Tabb Textiles Co., 

Inc. Opelika, AL

Uniforms 

Manufacturing. Inc. 

Scottsdale, AZ

Victory Supply, 

Inc. Lexington, 

KY

No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

1 Mattress /Pillow Sewn in Combo  No Bid $47.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

2 Blankets No Bid $11.50 No Bid $6.90 No Bid $5.59 No Bid No Bid $5.90 No Bid No Bid

3 Towels $15.00 $19.74 No Bid $15.54 No Bid $12.76 $20.00 No Bid $14.70 No Bid $14.69

4 Navy Blue Sheet Material $1.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.74 No Bid No Bid $1.99 No Bid No Bid

5 Shoes Male Size 6 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

6 Shoes Male Size 7 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

7 Shoes Male Size 8 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

8 Shoes Male Size 9 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

9 Shoes Males Size 10 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

10 Shoes Males Size 11 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

11 Shoes Male Size 12 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

12 Shoes Male Size 13 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

13 Shoes Male Size 14 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

14 Shoes Male Size 15 $3.75 $4.78 $8.30 $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

15 Shoes Female Size 5 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

16 Shoes Female Size 6 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

17 Shoes Female Size 7 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

18 Shoes Female Size 8 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

19 Shoes Female Size 9 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

 



ACME Supply Co., 

LTD 

Glen Cove, NY

Bob Barker Company, 

Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC

California Prison 

Industry Authority 

Folsom, CA

Charm-Tex 

Brooklyn, NY

Gold Water 

Industries, Inc. 

Gardena, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 

Inc. Waco, TX

Poltex International 

Inc. McDonough, GA

Robinson 

Textiles 

Gardena, CA

Tabb Textiles Co., 

Inc. Opelika, AL

Uniforms 

Manufacturing. Inc. 

Scottsdale, AZ

Victory Supply, 

Inc. Lexington, 

KY

No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

20 Shoes Female Size 10 $3.75 $4.78 No Bid $4.54 $3.47 $4.59 No Bid $5.75 No Bid $6.40 $4.89

21 Coveralls Red/White Small No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.45 $9.89

22 Coveralls Red/White Medium No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.79 $10.64

23 Coveralls Red/White  Large No Bid $11.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $10.10 $10.87

24 Coveralls Red/White X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $10.65 $11.79

25 Coveralls Red/White 2X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.05 $11.79

26 Coveralls Red/White 3X-Large No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.45 $11.99

27 Coveralls Red/White 4 X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.75 $11.99

28 Coveralls Red/White 5X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.39

29 Coveralls Red/White 6X-Large No Bid $13.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.74

30 Coveralls Green/White Small No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.45 $9.89

31 Coveralls Green/White Medium No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.79 $10.64

32 Coveralls Green/White Large No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $10.10 $10.87

33 Coveralls Green/White X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $10.65 $11.79

34 Coveralls Green/White 2X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.05 $11.79

35 Coveralls Green/White 3X-Large No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.45 $11.99

36 Coveralls Green/White 4X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.75 $11.99

37 Coveralls Green/White 5 X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.39

38 Coveralls Green/White 6X-Large No Bid $13.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.99 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.74

39 Coveralls Orange/White Small No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.45 $9.89

 



ACME Supply Co., 

LTD 

Glen Cove, NY

Bob Barker Company, 

Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC
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Industry Authority 

Folsom, CA
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Brooklyn, NY

Gold Water 

Industries, Inc. 

Gardena, CA
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No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

40 Coveralls Orange/White Medium No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.79 $10.64

41 Coveralls Orange/White Large No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $10.10 $10.87

42 Coveralls Orange/White X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $10.65 $11.79

43 Coveralls Orange/White 2X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.05 $11.79

44 Coveralls Orange/White 3X-Large No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.45 $11.99

45 Coveralls Orange/White 4X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.75 $11.99

46 Coveralls Orange/White 5X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.39

47 Coveralls Black/White Small No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $9.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.45 $9.89

48 Coveralls Black/White Medium No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.99 No Bid $9.25 No Bid $9.79 $10.64

49 Coveralls Black/White Large No Bid $10.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $10.00 No Bid $10.10 $10.87

50 Coveralls Black/White X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $10.65 $11.79

51 Coveralls Black/White 2X-Large No Bid $11.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.05 $11.79

52 Coveralls Black/White 3X-Large No Bid $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.45 $11.99

53 Coveralls Black/White 4X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $11.75 $11.99

54 Coveralls Black/White 5X-Large No Bid $12.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.39

55 Coveralls Black/White 6X-Large No Bid $13.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $11.30 No Bid $12.15 $12.74

56 Coveralls Solid Navy Large $15.00 $10.30 $21.20 No Bid No Bid $11.49 No Bid $9.00 No Bid $10.30 $10.87

57 Coveralls Solid Navy X-Large $15.00 $11.60 $21.20 No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $10.30 $11.79

58 Coveralls Solid Navy 2X-Large $15.00 $11.60 $23.50 No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $10.30 $11.79

59 Coveralls Solid Navy 3X-Large $15.00 $12.00 $23.50 No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $11.30 $11.99

 



ACME Supply Co., 

LTD 

Glen Cove, NY

Bob Barker Company, 

Inc. Fuquay Varina, NC

California Prison 

Industry Authority 

Folsom, CA

Charm-Tex 

Brooklyn, NY

Gold Water 

Industries, Inc. 

Gardena, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 

Inc. Waco, TX

Poltex International 

Inc. McDonough, GA

Robinson 

Textiles 

Gardena, CA

Tabb Textiles Co., 

Inc. Opelika, AL

Uniforms 

Manufacturing. Inc. 

Scottsdale, AZ

Victory Supply, 

Inc. Lexington, 

KY

No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

60 Coveralls Solid Navy 4X-Large $15.00 $12.54 $23.50 No Bid No Bid $12.16 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $11.30 $11.99

61 Coveralls Solid Navy 5X-Large $15.00 $12.54 $25.75 No Bid No Bid $12.49 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $11.30 $12.39

62 Coveralls Solid Navy 6X-Large $15.00 $13.40 $25.75 No Bid No Bid $12.99 No Bid $10.40 No Bid $12.45 $12.74

63
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue Small
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $3.50 No Bid $3.99 $4.17

64
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue Medium
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $3.50 No Bid $4.25 $4.17

65
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue Large
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $4.25 $4.37

66
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue X- Large
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $4.40 $4.37

67
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue 2X- Large
No Bid $4.55 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $4.45 $4.49

68
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue 3X- Large
No Bid $4.55 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $4.60 $4.49

69
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue 4X- Large
No Bid $4.80 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.93 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $4.70 $4.84

70
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirts 

Solid Blue 5X- Large
No Bid $4.80 $12.65 No Bid No Bid $5.54 No Bid $3.90 No Bid $3.85 $4.84

71
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange Small
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $3.99 $4.17

72
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange Medium
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.25 $4.17

73
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange Large
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.25 $4.37

74
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange X- Large
No Bid $4.24 $9.70 No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.40 $4.37

75
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange 2X- Large
No Bid $4.55 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.45 $4.49

76
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange 3X- Large
No Bid $4.55 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.60 $4.49

77
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange 4X- Large
No Bid $4.80 $11.15 No Bid No Bid $4.93 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.70 $4.84

 



ACME Supply Co., 
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No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

78
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Orange 5X- Large
No Bid $4.80 $12.65 No Bid No Bid $5.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $3.85 $4.84

79
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red Small
No Bid $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $3.99 $4.17

80
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red Medium
No Bid $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.25 $4.17

81
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red Large
No Bid $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.25 $4.37

82
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red  1X-Large
No Bid $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.40 $4.37

83
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red  2X-Large
No Bid $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.45 $4.49

84
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red  3X-Large
No Bid $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.60 $4.49

85
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red  4X-Large
No Bid $4.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.93 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.70 $4.84

86
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Red  5X-Large
No Bid $4.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $3.85 $4.84

87
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green Small
$5.00 $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $3.99 $4.17

88
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green Medium
$5.00 $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.59 No Bid $4.00 No Bid $4.25 $4.17

89
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green Large
$5.00 $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.25 $4.37

90
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green 1X-Large
$5.00 $4.24 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.14 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.40 $4.37

91
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green 2X-Large
$5.00 $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.45 $4.49

92
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green 3X-Large
$5.00 $4.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.60 $4.49

93
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green 4X-Large
$5.00 $4.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.93 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.70 $4.84

94
Female Uniforms V-Neck Tristitch Shirt 

Solid Green 5X-Large
$5.00 $4.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.54 No Bid $4.30 No Bid $4.70 $4.84
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No. Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price

95
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue Small
No Bid $5.60 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $4.71 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.75 $4.94

96
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue Medium
No Bid $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $4.99 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $5.33 $4.94

97
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue Large
No Bid $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $5.33 $5.29

98
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue 1X-Large
No Bid $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $5.45 $5.29

99
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue  2XLarge
No Bid $5.88 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $5.65 $5.49

100
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue 3X-Large
No Bid $5.88 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $5.72 $5.49

101
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue 4X-Large
No Bid $6.00 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.70 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $6.25 $5.97

102
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Blue 5X-Large
No Bid $6.45 $14.40 No Bid No Bid $6.31 No Bid $5.05 No Bid $4.70 $6.44

103
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange Small
$5.50 $5.60 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $4.71 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.00 $4.94

104
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange Medium
$5.50 $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $4.99 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.95 $4.94

105
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange Large
$5.50 $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.35 $5.29

106
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange 1X-Large
$5.50 $5.80 $10.85 No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.29

107
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange 2X-Large
$5.50 $5.88 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.49

108
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange 3X-Large
$5.50 $5.88 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.49

109
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange 4X-Large
$5.50 $6.00 $12.35 No Bid No Bid $5.70 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.97

110
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Orange 5X-Large
$5.50 $6.45 $14.40 No Bid No Bid $6.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $6.25 $6.44

111
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red Small
No Bid $5.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.71 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.70 $4.94
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112
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red Medium
No Bid $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.99 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.95 $4.94

113
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red Large
No Bid $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.35 $5.29

114
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red 1X-Large
No Bid $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.29

115
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red 2X-Large
No Bid $5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.49

116
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red 3X-Large
No Bid $5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.49

117
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red 4X-Large
No Bid $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.70 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.97

118
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Red 5X-Large
No Bid $6.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $6.25 $6.44

119
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green Small
$5.50 $5.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.71 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.70 $4.94

120
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green Medium
$5.50 $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.99 No Bid $4.75 No Bid $4.95 $4.94

121
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green Large
$5.50 $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.35 $5.29

122
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green 1X-Large
$5.50 $5.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.29

123
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green 2X-Large
$5.50 $5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.55 $5.49

124
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green 3X-Large
$5.50 $5.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.51 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.49

125
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green 4X-Large
$5.50 $6.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.70 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $5.89 $5.97

126
Female Uniforms Tristitch Trousers Solid 

Green 5X-Large
$5.50 $6.45 No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.31 No Bid $5.50 No Bid $6.25 $6.44

0.00% 3.00% N/A N/A
Base on actual 

Cost Increase
2.00% 5.00% 0.00% 5.00% 5.00% 3.00%

0.00% 3.00% N/A N/A
Base on actual 

Cost Increase
4.00% 10.00% 0.00% 5.00% 5.00% 3.00%

Approved By (print) Date

Year 2

Percentage Increase for Future Years

Year 3

9/30/2013-AH

 

Approved By (signature)



  


