Bid #14-034 Computers, Laptops, Monitors, Printers and Scanners

Adjustment on line #6, 6b, 7, and 7b, quantities changed.

Professional Document

Adorama Inc. Bass Computers, Inc. CDW Government LLC. Checkpoint Services, Inc. Computer Upgrade King, LLC Decision Tree Inc. Netsync Network Solutions El
New York, NY Houston, TX Vernon Hills, IL El Paso, TX Powhatan, VA El Paso, TX Paso, TX Flsftemsm
350
# Description Qty | Unit Price | Total Price L:rcea;l Unit Price Total Price Ls;?l Unit Price Total Price Ls;?l Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Ls::(l Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price
Dell or HP PC wiMonitor $7(;9m25 $467,512.50 | $481537.88
1 Sm. Form Factor 650 No Bid No Bid No Bid $189.00 $844.00 $548,600.00 $565,058.00 $743.90 $483,534.00 $850.00 $552,500.00 $569,075.00 $731.00 $475,150.00 $619.42 $402,623.00 No Bid No Bid
Computer . $122,850.00 $126,535.50
(ILCD)
SIS0 (PON - $100841.00 | 10386623 | g5 00, G
1b Full Warranty 650§ NoBid No Bid No Bid QIS 5 ' $42,250.00 $43,517.50 5 yrs included 5 yrs included 5yrs included 5 ’ $60,840.00 No Bid No Bid
$4°-2° (LD 52600000 | $26,780.00 yrs yrs
VIS
Dell or HP Laptop - . . . . . ’ . .
2 Standard 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,131.00 $96,135.00 $99,019.05 $998.14 $84,841.90 $779.99 $66,299.15 $68,288.12 $1,044.00 $88,740.00 $707.33 $60,123.05 No Bid No Bid
. . . ) ) . $145.00- ) ] : $60.06- . .
2b Full Warranty 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3yrs $12,325.00 $12,694.75 3 yrs included 3 yrsincluded 3 yrs included s $5,105.10 No Bid No Bid
Dell or HP Laptop - High ) ) ) ) ) i . i i i ) ) $1680.18 $13,441.44 ) )
3 End User 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,369.79 $18,958.32 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,835.00 $14,680.00 $2.131.69 $17.053.52 No Bid No Bid
3 Full Warranty 8 | noBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3yrs included No Bid No Bid No Bid 3yrs included $94.01-3yrs | 975208 No Bid No Bid
$103.00-3 yrs $828.48
23" Widescreen Flat
4 Panel IPS LED HD 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $215.00 $2,580.00 $2,657.40 $142.99 $1,715.88 $155.00 $1,860.00 $1,915.80 $168.00 $2,016.00 $164.60 $1,975.20 No Bid No Bid
Monitor, any brand
. . . ) ) ] $34.00- : : $31.48- . .
4b Full Warranty 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3yis $408.00 $420.24 $29.00-4yrs $348.00 1 yrincluded 3 yrsincluded 4yis $377.76 No Bid No Bid
Elo 1715L AccuTouch
5 Monitor w/ 3 Track 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $600.00 $3,000.00 $3,090.00 $567.58 $2,837.90 $600.00 $3,000.00 $3,090.00 $579.00 $2,895.00 $629.37 $3,146.85 No Bid No Bid
Magnetic Card Reader
5b Full Warranty 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included 3 yrs included 1 yrincluded 3 yrs included 3 yrs included No Bid No Bid
6 HP Prlhr;lt:(;*:serjet 30 | $885.00 $26,550.00 $27,346.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $632.00 $18,960.00 $19,528.80 No Bid No Bid $675.00 $20,250.00 $20,857.50 $617.00 $18,510.00 $610.98 $18,329.40 No Bid No Bid
6b Full Warranty 30 | $94.40-4yrs| $2,832.00 $2,916.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid $131 ?/r(s)o $3,390.00 $3,491.70 No Bid No Bid 1 yrincluded $131 ;rgo $3,510.00 $131 320 $3,465.00 No Bid No Bid
7 HP Tg’gmgfjg:t Prol 45| Nosid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | $269.00 | $4,035.00 $4,156.05 No Bid No Bid $24000 |  $3,600.00 $370800 | s2s600 | $3:840.00 $249.98 $3,749.70 No Bid No Bid
. . . . . . . . : $48.00- $45.14- . .
7b Full Warranty 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.00-3yrs $660.00 $679.80 No Bid No Bid 1yrincluded 3yrs $720.00 s $677.10 No Bid No Bid
Printer HP Laserjet . . . . . . .
8 M602n 20 | $999.00 $19,980.00 $20,579.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $905.00 $18,100.00 $18,643.00 No Bid No Bid $900.00 $18,000.00 $18,540.00 $823.00 $16,460.00 $814.98 $16,299.60 No Bid No Bid
8b Full Warranty 20 | $64.40-4yrs| $1,288.00 $1,326.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid $231 320 $4,380.00 $4,511.40 No Bid No Bid 1yrincluded $2323‘r(s]0_ $4,580.00 $2323:4_ $4,468.80 No Bid No Bid
9 Rescind Scanner 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $830.00 $24,900.00 $25,647.00 No Bid No Bid $850.00 | $25,500.00 | $26,265.00 $375.00 $11,250.00 $371.28 $11,138.40 $990.00 $29,700.00
9b Rescind Full Warranty 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1??3.r[s)0- $5,400.00 $5,562.00 No Bid No Bid 1 yrincluded $54.00-3yrs $1,620.00 $22y:sg $1,583.70 $3373r20- $11,250.00
GRAND TOTAL $50,650.00 $52,169.50 $717,203.50 $738,719.61 $785,123.00 $808,676.69 $592,236.00 I $691,009.15 | $711,739.42 $643,971.00 $608,096.18 $40,950.00
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Technical & Scientific

1st Run Computer Services Inc. Garden City, | SDF Professional Computers, Inc. Greenville, v O Toshiba Business Solutions Zones, Inc.
NY NC Application, Inc. El Paso, TX Auburn, WA
Houston TX
# Description Qty | Unit Price Total Price Local Unit Price Total Price Local Unit Price Total Price Local Unit Price | Total Price Unit Price Total Price Local
Pref Pref Pref Pref
Dell or HP PC w/Monitor
1 Sm. Form Factor 650 ] NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $821.82 $534,183.00 $550,208.49 No Bid No Bid NgA&id NoAid id
Computer
1b Full Warranty 650 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5 yrs included No Bid No Bid NoAid NoAid id
Dell or HP Laptop - . . . ’ . ’
2 Standard 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,221.42 $103,820.70 $106,935.32 | $1,293.00 | $109,905.00 id id
. . . . . . ’ $472.00-3
2b Full Warranty 85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included s $40,120.00 id T Td
3 Del or :: d"S?L"rp “Hon g | Nosio No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,969.83 $15,758.64 $1623140 | NoBid No Bid d | |d
3b Full Warranty 8 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included No Bid No Bid Td
23" Widescreen Flat
4 Panel IPS LED HD 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $182.93 $2,195.16 $2,261.01 $157.00 $1,884.00 NoA&id id id
Monitor, any brand
4b Full Warranty 12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included 3 yrs included 1d T
Elo 1715L AccuTouch
5 Monitor w/ 3 Track 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid $626.62 $3,133.10 $3,227.09 $1,355.18 $6,775.90 $6,979.18 No Bid No Bid NoAid id id
Magnetic Card Reader
5b Full Warranty 5 No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included 3 yrs included No Bid No Bid
6 HP P”,\';ltg(; 1":56”91 30 | NoBid No Bid No Bid $65287 | $19586.10 | $20173.68 $345.00 $10,350.00 $10,66050 | $671.75 | $20,152.50 q |
6b Full Warranty 30 No Bid No Bid No Bid $131 3&9 $3,557.70 $3,664.43 3 yrs included $13;‘§5'3 $4,087.50 (] T
HP Printer Laserjet Pro . . .
7 400 M401dne 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $269.27 $4,039.05 $4,160.22 $837.92 $12,568.80 $12,945.86 $284.70 $4,270.50 id id
7b Full Warranty 15 No Bid No Bid No Bid $46.02-3 yrs $690.30 $711.01 3 yrs included $53.84-3 yrs $807.60 id id
Printer HP Laserjet . . .
8 M602n 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $933.08 $18,661.60 $19,221.45 $1,194.01 $23,880.20 $24,596.61 $959.22 $19,184.40 id T
. . . ’ $263.75-3
8b Full Warranty 20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $256.62-3yrs|  $5,132.40 $5,286.37 3 yrs included s $5,275.00 d
9 Award Scanner 30 | $846.00 $25,380.00 $26,141.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $4,891.18 | $146,735.40 | $151,137.46 $879.30 $26,379.00 $ 50 01
9b Award Full Warranty 30 3 yrs included No Bid No Bid No Bid 3 yrs included $16;rl:4-3 $5,026.20
GRAND TOTAL | $25,380.00 | $26,141.40 $54,800.25 $56,444.26 I $856,267.80 I $881,955.83 $237,091.70 | $23,983.50

Approved By (Signature)

Approved By (Print)
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Note: Zones, Inc is disqualified

due to no "Ethics Form".

Date

11/25/2014-EC revised



