Bid #14-050-I (Informal)
Building Materials for the County of El Paso

Chaparral Materials Inc.
El Paso, Texas

Copper State Bolt & Nut
El Paso, Texas

Desert Drywall Inc.
El Paso, Texas

WW.Grainger Inc.
El Paso, Texas

- Approx] Pack Unit Unit Pack Unit Unit pack Unit Unit Pack Unit Unit
Description Qty Size F:ost Cpst Size _Cost C_ost Size F:ost Cpst Size _Cost C_ost
Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery
Concrete Bonding Adhesive & Acrylic Fortifier 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Quikrete Concrete Bonding Adhesive #990201 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $16.09 | $16.09 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Dot 2ak Anchor Kit W/2-Way Scws 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $7.28 | $7.28 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $5.40 | $5.40
Flanged Drop In Anchors 1/4"-20 1" Depth 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $16.91 | $16.91 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 | $41.50 | $41.50
Ceiling Tile Fifth Avenue 280 2x4'x5/8" - 64 Sq. Ft. White Model 280 SKU 314803 | 100 12 $59.41 | $59.41 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 12 $76.26 | $76.26
Ceiling Tile Cross Tees Fire Rated 4'x1-1/2" White Model SDX/SDXL424 | 100 Each $5.16 | $5.16 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $2.86 | $2.86
Ceiling Tile Wall Angle 12' X 7/8" X 7/8" White Model Sm7/SKU 25805 | 100 Each | $4.42 | $4.42 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ NoBid | Each | $5.12 | $5.12
Quickrete 60Ib Sand/Topping Mix #110360 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Quikrete 60Ib Concrete Mix Ready To Use 110160 500 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ No Bid | No Bid | Each | $25.92 | $25.92
#11k352 Drywall Anchor Self Drill #6 100/Box 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $6.65 | $6.65 | No Bid [ No Bid | No Bid 100 | $14.65 | $14.65
1-1/8" Tension Pins 50# 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Drywall Stitcher 1-1/4 Fine 31# 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 8,000 | $85.88 | $85.88
Mod Truss Driller 1/2 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $1.30 | $1.30 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
1-1/4" X 10' Corner Bead 500 Each | $1.50 | $1.50 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
158 Track 10' 25 Gauge 500 Each | $2.07 | $2.07 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
3-5/8" X 8' Track 25 Gauge 500 Each | $2.46 | $2.46 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
3-5/8x10' Track 20 Gauge ST35810' 500 Each | $4.14 | $4.14 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
5/8" Metal L-Bead 10' Pc 500 Each | $1.70 | $1.70 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
1-1/4" X 8' Metal Corner Bead 500 Each | $1.20 | $1.20 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
60:25 Caulk Gun 50 No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | Each | $5.98 | $5.98 Each | $2.48 | $2.48 | Each | $5.64 | $5.64
Owens Corning Eco-Touch 3-1/2" X 15" X 32' R-13 Draft | 500 Bag | $18.72 | $18.72 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
|R-19 Fiberglass Insulation 39'-2"L X 23"Wx6-1/2"'D UNFCD 24 X 48 128.00 SF 500 Bag | $23.52 | $23.52 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
All-Purpose Pre-Mixed Joint Compound 5Ib. Bucket 100 Box $7.90 | $7.90 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |5Ib bucket| $3.59 | $3.59
Joint Compound USG All Purpose Il 61 7# PL 500 Box $8.50 [ $8.50 | No Bid | NoBid | No Bid | Each | $15.99 | $15.99 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Sheetrock Brand Drywall Joint Tape 250" Roll 100 Roll $1.84 [ $1.84 | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | Each | $1.89 | $1.89 | Each | $4.15 | $4.15
1X4X8 Select White Pine Board Part #489291 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
1X6X8 Select Pine Board Part #928919 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Hang Wire 12 Gauge 12' 50# 50 100 | $40.00 | $40.00 | 100 | $45.68 | $45.68 | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | Each | $4.88 | $4.88
3/8" Hex Nuts (100/Pk) 500 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $1.91 | $1.91 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $5.45 | $5.45
2" Nylon Thin Angle Sash Brush Model 0H21270020 50 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $8.99 | $8.99 | Each | $4.47 | $4.47
2-1/2" Nylon Thin Angle Sash Brush Model 0H21270024 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | Each | $10.85 | $10.85 | Each $5.30 | $5.30
4" Ultra-Dense Foam Roller Cover 5/PK Model 4FOAMQ-5H | 50 | NoBid | No Bid | NopBige|jNo Bid | No Bid | No Bid |10 Pack] $7.67 | $7.67 | Each | $0.92 | $0.92




Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Ap()?pt;ox Z?ZC: Cost Cost F;?;:(I: Cost Cost Z?ZC: Cost Cost F;?;:(I: Cost Cost
Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery Pick-Up | Delivery

Description

4" X 3/8" White Woven Roller Cover 2/PK Model RS1012 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 2 Pack | $3.99 $3.99 2 $3.52 $3.52

9" X 1-1/4" High Density Polyester Roller Cover Model RC 147 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each $3.99 | $3.99 Each $1.13 | $1.13

12" Frame For 4" Mini Roller Covers Model 4RL-12 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each $1.68 | $1.68 Each $1.05 | $1.05
4" Roller Frame Model RF200-4 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each $1.35 | $1.35 Each $1.23 | $1.23
9" Heavy Duty Roller Frame Model RF 211-9 50 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | NoBid | Each | $2.42 | $2.42 | Each | $0.88 | $0.88

1 Gallon Rustoleum Gloss White Exterior Paint DTM ALKYD 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $25.99 | $25.99 | Each | $52.15 | $52.15

Ramset 0.22 Caliber Yellow Single Shot Powder Loads (100 CT) | 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $5.58 | $5.58 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $6.74 | $6.74

Ramset 2-1/2" Drive Pins With Washers (100 PK) 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $7.43 | $7.43 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $12.87 | $12.87
31317 1-1/2X10YD 120 Sandcloth 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each $9.25 | $9.25
4-3/16" X 11-1/4" 80D Grit Drywall Sanding Sheets 25/PK| 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |25 Pack| $6.65 | $6.65 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
Self Tap Screws-Phillips Head 5/8" L (100/Pk) 1000 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $1.57 | $1.57 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid

#6 X 1-1/4" Fine Phosphate-Plated Steel Bugle-Head Phillips Drywall Screws (100/Pk) [ 500 ]8000/Box| $60.00 | $60.00 100 $0.87 | $0.87 | No Bid [ No Bid | No Bid 100 $1.10 | $1.10

#8 X 1/2" Fine Zinc-Plated Steel Modified Truss-Head Phillips Self Drilling (100/Pk) 500 |J10000/Box| $77.00 | $77.00 100 $1.05 $1.05 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 100 $2.75 $2.75

#8 X 1-1/4" Coarse Steel Bugle-Head Phillips Drywall Screws 5 Lb Box | 100 ]6000/Box| $47.00 | $47.00 100 $1.35 | $1.35 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid

#8 X 1-5/8" Coarse Phosphate-Plated Steel Bugle-Head Phillips (100/Pk) | 100 |5000/Box| $38.00 | $38.00 100 $1.49 $1.49 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid 400 $61.50 | $61.50

Fastener Pin With Washer 2 1/2IN PK 100 2HNZ3 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
CM CP 25WB+ Fire Barrier Caulk 10 0z. 4-Hour Fire Rating ASTM E814 ASTM E 1966 50 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ No Bid | Each | $14.16 | $14.16 | Each | $9.78 | $9.78
4'X8'X1/2" Regular Drywall 100 Each | $10.53 | $10.53 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
4'X8'X5/8" Fire Code Drywall 1000 | Each | $11.84 | $11.84 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
4'X8'X5/8" Regular Drywall 1000 | Each | $14.72 | $14.72 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
158 STUD 8'25 Gauge 1000 | Each | $1.84 | $1.84 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
3-5/8" X 10' 25 Gauge Galvanized Steel Wall Framing Stud | 1000 | Each $3.20 | $3.20 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
358 S-STUD 8' 20 Gauge 1000 | Each | $3.40 | $3.40 | NoBid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
358 S-STUD 16' 20 Gauge 50 Each | $6.81 | $6.81 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid
243270 Masking Tape Natural 2" X 60 YD 100 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid [ NoBid | No Bid | Each | $2.75 | $2.75 | Each | $6.56 | $6.56
Masking Tape 2" X 60 YD 24 Rolls Per Case 100 | No Bid [ No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Case | $65.40 | $65.40 | 24 pk | $56.75 | $56.75
Paint Thinner Model GKPT94002P 20 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Gallon | $7.96 | $7.96 lgal | $82.67 | $82.67
Ramset Mastershot 0.22 Caliber Powder Actuator Tool 20 No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $82.55 | $82.55 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | Each | $75.57 | $75.57
Supplemental ltems: 10% 65-70% 10% 10%
Delivery
Per Iltem 0 0 no min
PerTrip $12.00 0 0 0 standard delivery
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