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Silsbee Ford Casa Ford Inc. Dick Poe Dodge LP Dick Poe Motors LP Rudolph Chevrolet LLC
Silsbee, Texas El Paso, Texas El Paso, Texas El Paso, Texas El Paso, Texas
L . Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended . Extended
Department Description Qty | Make/Model | Unit Cost Local Preff Make/Model | Unit Cost Make/Model | Unit Cost Make/Model | Unit Cost Make/Model | Unit Cost
Cost Cost Cost Cost Cost
. 2016 Ford . , . . 2015 Chrysler/ 2015 Chevy
Midsize Sedans 11 & $18,937.36 | $208,311.00 | $214,560.33 | 2016 Ford Fusion | $26,412.96 | $290,542.56 No Bid No Bid No Bid UFCH41 200 $21,233.00 | $233,563.00 Malibu $19,185.00 | $211,035.00
’ Limited
Sheriff Full Size 4x4 Pick-up Truck |\ | 5515 £ series | $85,302.70 | $35,302.70 | $36,454.48 | 2015 Ford F150 | $36404.46 | $36.40446 |201°D0dgERaM [ o0 con83 | $32,602.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2015 Chevy $30,479.00 | $30,479.00
w/Work Shell Camper DS6L98 Silverado 1500
. . . . . . . 2015 Chevy
15 Passenger Van 1 2015 Ford Transit | $34,019.88 $34,019.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Express 3500 $29,599.00 $29,599.00
Facilities Pick-up Truck 1/2 Ton 2015 Dodge Ram ) ) ) 2015 Chevy
Management Extended Cah Short Bed 2 2015 Ford F150 | $29,233.08 $58,466.16 - $23,984.20 $47,968.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid Silverado 1500 $24,247.00 $48,494.00
Tax Assessor Midsize SUV 1 |2016 Ford Int. SUV| $27,321.50 | $27,321.50 | $28,141.15 2016 Ford $28,211.44 | $28211.44 20ECos $27,860.00 | $27,860.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2015 Chevy $25,789.00 | $25,789.00
Explorer Durango Traverse
SouthWest Truck Sales Larrscoran-Management LLC-
El Paso, Texas Hillshboro, TX
L . . Extended
Department Description Qty | Make/Model | Unit Cost Extended Cost Make/Model | Unit Cost Cost
2015 Dodge-Dart]
Midsize Sedans 11 No Bid No Bid No Bid $18,703.00- $205,733.00-
£X-2015-Chrysler
Sheriff ) )
Full Size 4x4 Pick-up Truck 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid . . Bi
w/Work Shell Camper
15 Passenger Van I \Z‘:;;'ans'l $29,917.99 $29,917.99 No-Bid No-Bid NoBid
Facilities Pick-up Truck 1/2 Ton
i i No Bid 2015Ram-1500 | $20.779.00 | $41,558.00
Management Extended Cab Short Bed 2 No Bid No Bid o5 ’ '
Tax Assessor Midsize SUV 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid 2035 Dodge $21,100.00 $21.100.00
NOTE:
Larrscoran Management, LLC has been
disqualified. No Ethics Training was submitted.
Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print) Date 2/24/2015-EC

revised 3/13/2015-EC
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