Bid 15-018
Tires for the County of El Paso
Opening Date: Monday, May 18, 2015

Group 1: Automobiles

Bridgestone Americas Tire
. . _— ) ) - ) ; GVMI INC. dba Sun )
American Tire Distributors Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Bill Williams Tire Operations, LLC dba GCR Auto Repair Pep Boys Tire Centers, LLC
Carrollton, TX Amarillo, TX Midland, TX Tires & Service p Philadelphia, PA El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
) . Unit | 3% Local Unit |3% Local Unit | 3% Local . . Unit Unit | 3% Local . .
No. Tire Size Brand ) Brand . Brand ) Brand Unit Price | Brand ) Brand . Brand | Unit Price
Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Price Pref.
1 215/60R16 Kelly $67.88 $69.92 Starfire $55.00 $56.65 Uniroyal $81.45 $83.89 FS140718 $75.92 Mastercraft $64.99 Starfire $59.84 $61.64 TBC $55.81
2 P275/65R18 Firestone $114.50 $117.94 Starfire $109.00 $112.27 BFG $185.80 $191.37 fs136060 $120.53 Firestone $155.53 Cooper $159.46 $164.24 TBC $136.18
3 LT245/75R16 Firestone $104.60 $107.74 Starfire $107.00 $110.21 Uniroyal $161.38 $166.22 FS189582 $132.47 Mastercraft $108.05 Cooper $146.46 $150.85 TBC $99.67
4 P205/65R15 Kelly $62.01 $63.87 Starfire $50.00 $51.50 Uniroyal $69.55 $71.64 FS140633 $62.50 Firestone $69.99 Starfire $54.08 $55.70 TBC $48.50
5 P265/70R17 Firestone $107.17 $110.39 Starfire $107.00 $110.21 Uniroyal $118.44 $121.99 FS026784 $126.80 Firestone $132.86 Cooper $108.68 $111.94 TBC $103.74
6 P225/60R16 Firestone $72.69 $74.87 Starfire $55.00 $56.65 Uniroyal $77.03 $79.34 FS138559 $96.62 No Bid No Bid Starfire $62.86 $64.75 TBC $57.31
7 LT245/75R17/E Firestone $115.06 $118.51 Starfire $112.00 $115.36 BFG $153.13 $157.72 FS207483 $123.66 Mastercraft $142.93 General $179.49 $184.87 TBC $135.42
8 LT235/85/16/10 Firestone $109.06 $112.33 Starfire $112.00 $115.36 Uniroyal $159.72 $164.51 FS189718 $114.80 Mastercraft $110.19 Cooper $158.10 $162.84 TBC $100.14
9 185/65R14 Firestone $51.18 $52.72 Starfire $41.00 $42.23 Uniroyal $62.09 $63.95 FS117615 $63.69 Mastercraft $51.69 Starfire $40.79 $42.01 TBC $36.36
10 P235/70R16 Firestone $87.97 $90.61 Starfire $86.00 $88.58 BFG $110.11 $113.41 FS197759 $103.34 Firestone $162.27 Cooper $126.99 $130.80 Uniroyal $95.35
11 225/70R19.5 Hercules $132.54 $136.52 Cooper $131.00 $134.93 Cont $275.00 $283.25 FS160716 $211.37 Mastercraft $162.27 Cooper $191.24 $196.98 Hankook $205.96
Group 2: Off Road Tires-Heavy Duty Tires
. . . ) 3% Local Unit 3% Local . . 3% Local . . . . . . 3% Local . .
NO. Tire Size Brand |Unit Price Brand . Brand |Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price|] Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price
Pref. Price Pref. Pref. Pref.
_ Samson $112.94 $116.33 Samson $116.00 $119.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid Sam trailer $158.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 11R22.5/16 Hercules $251.53 $259.08 Cooper $214.00 $220.42 Cont/Gen | $317.04 No Bid FST241252 $338.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 11R24.5/16 Hercules $265.38 $273.34 Cooper $224.00 $230.72 Cont/Gen | $339.01 $349.18 FST233840 $361.35 No Bid No Bid Bridgestone | $617.99 $636.53 No Bid No Bid
14.00-24/12 . . . . . . . .
4 ERS G2 RB SGG Firestone $478.33 $492.68 Samson $340.00 $350.20 BKT $636.23 $655.32 FS425214 $522.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14.00-24/12 . . . . . . . .
5 BW G4 RB DT Firestone $748.68 $771.14 Samson $600.00 $618.00 BKT $1,127.38 $1,161.20 FS425656 $815.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 13.6-24/8 Firestone $589.84 $607.54 Firestone $300.00 $309.00 MX $995.98 $1,025.86 FS372575 $708.09 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 16.9-34/6 Titan $621.88 $640.54 Firestone $670.00 $690.10 BKT $540.00 $556.20 Titan 32419402 $785.80 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Bridgestone Americas Tire

GVMI INC. dba Sun

Group 3: Trucks /Vans / Buses

American Tire Distributors Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Bill Williams Tire Operations, LLC dba GCR Auto Repair Pep Boys Tire Centers, LLC
Carrollton, TX Amarillo, TX Midland, TX Tires & Service p Philadelphia, PA El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
. . o 3% Local Unit 3% Local o 3% Local . . . 3% Local o
No. Tire Size Brand |Unit Price ’ Brand . > Brand |Unit Price ’ Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price Brand Unit Price ’ Brand Unit Price
Pref. Price Pref. Pref. Pref.
8 17.5-25/12 Firestone | $543.87 $560.19 Samson | $500.00 $515.00 BKT $666.55 $686.55 FST425129 $587.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 17.5-25/16 Firestone | $617.82 $636.35 Samson $515.00 $530.45 BKT $764.05 $786.97 FST425180 $667.46 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
_ Carlisle $41.16 $42.39 Duro $26.00 $26.78 Carlisle $51.82 $53.37 Carlisle $52.86 No Bid No Bid Carlisle $53.19 $54.79 No Bid No Bid
11 20.5-25/20 Firestone | $1,065.14 $1,097.09 Samson $850.00 $875.50 BKT $1,080.85 $1,113.28 FS414646 $1,150.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 305/70D16.5/10 Firestone $172.94 $178.13 Firestone $230.00 $236.90 No Bid No Bid No Bid FS362131 $244.66 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 7.50-14/14TT Good year $121.85 $125.51 Samson $116.00 $119.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
14 10.00-16/8tt f2 3 rib Carlisle $140.53 $144.75 Firestone $160.00 $164.80 BKT $151.00 $155.53 FS350877 $236.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
15 11L-15/10 Firestone $189.95 $195.65 Samson $115.00 $118.45 BKT $200.58 $206.60 FS326011 $196.09 No Bid No Bid Carlisle $202.99 $209.08 No Bid No Bid
16 111L-16/10 Firestone $127.93 $131.77 Firestone $125.00 $128.75 BKT $218.03 $224.57 FS359831 $204.57 No Bid No Bid Carlisle $218.99 $225.56 No Bid No Bid
Carlisle $42.33 $43.60 Duro $27.00 $27.81 BKT $54.09 $55.71 CARLISLE $56.41 No Bid No Bid Carlisle $92.99 $95.78 No Bid No Bid

) . Unit | 3% Local Unit |3% Local Unit | 3% Local . Unit Unit | 3% Local o

No. Tire Size Brand ; Brand ) Brand ; Brand Unit Price Brand ; Brand ) Brand | Unit Price

Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Price Pref.

1 LT265/75R16 Firestone $119.90 $123.50 Starfire $120.00 $123.60 Uniroyal $144.03 $148.35 FST189599 $129.22 Mastercraft $120.11 Cooper $169.99 $175.09 BFG $161.03
2 ST225/75R15/10 Hercules $71.67 $73.82 Gladiator $61.00 $62.83 AK $143.40 $147.70 PWO003503 $70.20 N/B N/B Supercargo $120.99 $124.62 TBC $59.66
3 LT225/75R16/10 Firestone $105.95 $109.13 Starfire $95.00 $97.85 Mich $144.85 $149.20 FS189752 $111.53 Mastercraft $95.89 Definity $130.99 $134.92 TBC $86.28
4 LT245/75R17/10 Firestone $114.95 $118.40 Starfire $112.00 $115.36 Mich $156.88 $161.59 FS205222 $124.66 Mastercraft $142.93 Cooper $175.99 $181.27 BFG $179.02
5 LT265/70R17/10 Firestone $127.47 $131.29 Starfire $125.00 $128.75 BFG $201.65 $207.70 FS200190 $137.39 Mastercraft $121.50 Cooper $179.99 $185.39 BFG $134.01
6 195/60R15 Firestone $54.40 $56.03 Starfire $48.00 $49.44 Uniroyal $63.18 $65.08 FS140582 $59.81 Mastercraft $59.91 Definity $66.49 $68.48 TBC $45.16
7 P235/75/R17 Firestone $105.20 $108.36 Cooper $125.00 $128.75 BFG $126.08 $129.86 FS054239 $110.74 N/B N/B Hankook $114.74 $118.18 Hankook $119.86
8 LT225/75/R17 Firestone $103.64 $106.75 Cooper $142.00 $146.26 FS $171.22 $176.36 FS224150 $111.35 Mastercraft $135.60 Cooper $189.14 $194.81 Hankook $148.27
9 P235/70/R17 Firestone | $96.82 $99.72 Cooper | $125.00 | $128.75 FS $19864 | $204.60 FS097776 $101.92 Fﬁgg:’;ﬁé $93.40 Falken $146.19 | $15058 TBC $107.46
10 P235/75/R16 Firestone $100.52 $103.54 Cooper $95.00 $97.85 Uniroyal $104.34 $107.47 FS140378 $105.82 Firestone $107.88 Definity $117.79 $121.32 BFG $117.90
11 P205/70/R15 Firestone $56.88 $58.59 Starfire $51.00 $52.53 Uniroyal $73.73 $75.94 FS047150 $80.45 Mastercraft $65.57 General $72.99 $75.18 TBC $52.44
12 LT245/70/R17 Firestone $111.41 $114.75 Cooper $140.00 $144.20 FS $171.88 $177.04 FS192234 $117.32 Fﬁ;g:gr?; $121.52 General $148.49 $152.94 TBC $121.04
13 LT225/75/§1%7/10/116_ Firestone $105.78 $108.95 Cooper $160.00 $164.80 N/B N/B N/B FS224150 $111.35 N/B N/B Cooper $189.14 $194.81 Hankook $151.02
14 P225/65/R17 Firestone $78.95 $81.32 Cooper $100.00 $103.00 Uniroyal $108.95 $112.22 FS097946 $84.77 Firestone $90.57 Cooper $121.24 $124.88 Hankook $89.88
15 225/65/R17 Firestone $79.95 $82.35 Cooper $100.00 $103.00 Uniroyal $94.97 $97.82 FS097606 $98.49 Mastercraft $101.58 Continental $124.99 $128.74 Uniroyal $103.32
16 P225/50/R17 Uniroyal $83.46 $85.96 Cooper $95.00 $97.85 Uniroyal $104.92 $108.07 FS146872 $121.69 Bridgestone $151.66 Cooper $117.36 $120.88 Hankook $109.18
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Group 4: Pursuit Tires

Bridgestone Americas Tire
. . N . . - ! . GVMI INC. dba Sun !

American Tire Distributors Ato Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Bill Williams Tire Operations, LLC dba GCR Auto Repair Pep Boys Tire Centers, LLC

Carrollton, TX Amarillo, TX Midland, TX Tires & Service P Philadelphia, PA El Paso, TX

El Paso, TX
El Paso, TX
) . Unit | 3% Local Unit |3% Local Unit | 3% Local . . Unit Unit | 3% Local . .
No. Tire Size Brand ) Brand ) Brand ; Brand Unit Price Brand ; Brand ) Brand | Unit Price
Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Pref. Price Price Pref.

1 245-55R18 103W Firestone | $118.93 $122.50 Cooper $155.00 $159.65 FS $280.00 $288.40 FS146600 $160.35 No Bid No Bid Firestone $439.99 $453.19 No Bid No Bid
2 P265/60R17 108V Firestone | $112.86 $116.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid FS $265.00 $272.95 FST023189 $117.36 No Bid No Bid Firestone $429.99 $442.89 No Bid No Bid
3 235/55R17 Firestone $99.99 $102.99 Cooper $ 115.00| $118.45 FS $226.00 $232.78 FST077325 $105.38 Mastercraft $108.43 Firestone $374.99 $386.24 No Bid No Bid
4 P225/60R16 97V Firestone $87.81 $90.44 Cooper $ 115.00| $118.45 FS $148.00 $152.44 FS067911 $92.31 Mastercraft $90.91 Firestone $269.99 $278.09 No Bid No Bid

Prices for mounting tires if needed:

Bid price shall be for mounting each tire.

. . _— . . - . Bridgestone Americas Tire Operations, LLC
American Tire Distributors, A'to Z Tire & Battery, Inc. Bill Williams Tire g - P .
) ) dba GCR Tires & Service
Carrollton, TX Amarillo, TX Midland, TX
El Paso, TX
Trucks Trucks/ Trucks/ Trucks/
Cars Buses Other Cars Buses | Other Cars Buses Other Cars Buses Other
/Vans Vans Vans Vans
Mount and Dismount Labor No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0 w.pur 0 w. pur 0 w.pur No Bid $10.00 $12.50 $30.00 /ii:g
Computerized Spin Balance No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.00 $15.00 $25.00 No Bid $16.00 $16.00 $30.00 N/B
R ) ) ) ) ) ) ) ) $1.00
Tire Disposal Fee No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.00 $5.00 $10.00 $20.00 $3.50 $5.00 $12.00 x Ib weight
Shop Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $15.00
Ci terized Wheel
Aﬁ;}?ﬁ;ﬂ'ze ee No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid NoBid | NoBid No Bid No Bid $100.00/axle No Bid $49.99 $50.99 $189.00 N/B
Cost for Mobile unit (for $95.00
mounting tires at location No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $55.00 $55.00 $55.00 $65.00 $82.00/hr $82.00/hr $82.00/hr /h.r
requested by department)
Fix or Repair Flat Tires No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.00 $15.00 $25.00 No Bid $17.50 $20.00 $35.00 | $2.50/x sect
GVMI INC. dba Sun Auto Repair Pep Boys Tire Centers, LLC
El Paso, TX Philadelphia, PA El Paso, TX
Trucks/ Trucks/ Trucks/ Note: The following tires are not on the preferred list.---AK-
Cars Vans Buses Other Cars Vans Buses | Other Cars Vans Buses Other Akuret, BKT-Blakrishna, Carlisle, Duro, Hankook,
Mount and Dismount Labor $8.50 $8.50 $10.50 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Mastercraft, Samson, Supercargo
Computerized Spin Balance $4.50 $4.50 $5.50 No Bid $12.74 $12.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Tire Disposal Fee $2.50 $2.50 $3.50 No Bid $2.00 $2.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Approved By (Signature)
Shop Parts No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Ci terized Wheel
Al? gmeirt'ze ee $69.95 $69.95 $129.00 No Bid $48.00 $48.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Approved By (Prnt)
Cost for Mobile unit (for
mounting tires at location No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
requested by department)
Fix or Repair Flat Tires $9.50 $9.50 $10.50 No Bid $12.00 $12.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Date

6/15/2015-EC
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