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Brady 
Industries 

El Paso, TX

Inter. Laundry 
Services Inc 
El Paso, TX

Laun-Dry 
Supply Co. 

Inc.
El Paso, TX

South-
western Mill 

Dist
El Paso, TX

Spectrum 
Paper Co., 

Inc. 
El Paso, TX

Sun 
Plastics, Inc. 
El Paso, TX

# Description Est. Qt. Cost
Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref

a) $36.00 a) 37.08

b) $34.00 b) $35.02

2 Bag Paper #10  500 
bags/bdl 90 bdls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.15                    
500bgs/bdl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$10.57                    
500/bdl No Bid

$29.98                   
500/bdl $30.88 

$10.50                       
500/pkg

$10.56
500/bdl No Bid No Bid No Bid

3 Bag Paper #12  500 
bags/bdl 90 bdls No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$16.21                    
500bgs/bdl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$13.29                       
500/bdl                            No Bid

$30.98                    
500/bdl $31.91 

$13.02                          
500/pkg

$13.16
500/bdl No Bid No Bid No Bid

4 Bag-Polybag-Plastic-
Clear Qt 4 x 2 x 12 

40 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.74 $13.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.00                                         
1000/cs

$5.99                   
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

5
Bag-Polybag-Plastic-
Sandwich-Flip Top 
6.75" x 6.75 " +1 reg.-

 110 pkg No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.89
110

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.82 $9.08 $13.99                         
2000/pk

No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.95                   
2000/cs

$6.92                
2000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

6
Bleach-Clorox 5.25% 
Sodium Hypochlorite 
Super Disinfectant 

200 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$9.74                               

3 gal/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$8.79                  

6 gal/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid
$7.31                       

6 gal/cs
$7.85                 

6gal/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

7 Bowl-Soup-Styrofoam 
5 oz  200 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$25.19                               
1250/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$16.23                     
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.52              
1000/cs 

$15.58            
1000/cs

$15.50                    
1000/cs No Bid No Bid

8 Bowl Soup-Styrofoam 
8 oz.

96 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.02                      
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $30.42                 
1000/cs                

No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.95             
1000/cs

$29.39            
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

9  Bowl-Soup-Styrofoam 
12 oz. 270 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$17.96                    
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$19.25                     
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$18.84         
1000/cs

$18.80                              
1000/cs $16.90 No Bid No Bid

10 Broom-Unisan-Plastic-
Flag Tip 42 x 88 50 cs No Bid No Bid

$89.64                       
dz. $92.33 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$46.08                 
12/cs $47.47 

$37.86                     
6/cs

$37.50          
12/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

11

Broom-Angled 
Fiberglass 
w/polypropylene 
bristles trim 10" wide

515 cs No Bid No Bid
$89.64                       

dz. $92.33 $53.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$49.58                  
12/cs No Bid

$95.88               
12/cs $98.76 

$37.86                           
6/cs

$44.80                  
12/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

12 Bucket-Mop 26 qt. 
w/wringer yellow 65 SET No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.01 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $57.62 $59.35 No Bid No Bid $33.80 No Bid $41.65 $42.90 $44.50 $34.65 No Bid No Bid No Bid

13
Cafeteria-Kitchen-
Food Wrap 18 x 1000 
(plastic)

200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.96 $8.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.87 $10.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid

14
Cafeteria-Kitchen-
Food Wrap 18 x 2000 
(plastic)

200 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.74 $11.98 $12.34 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.69 $12.70 $10.99 No Bid No Bid

15 Cafeteria -Kitchen Roll 
18x1000 (heavy duty foil)

40 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $39.51 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid $33.65 $36.60 No Bid No Bid No Bid

16
Cap-Cafeteria-Bouffont 
Color:  White 
10/100/cs

96 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$21.05                      
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.14 $21.77 No Bid No Bid

$27.90                 
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.35                            
1000/cs

$20.98               
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

17 Cap-Cafeteria-Bouffont 
Color:  Blue 10/100/cs 96 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$21.62                
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.88 $22.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.35                            
1000/cs

$21.50                
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

18
Cap-Cafeteria-Bouffont 
Color: Green 
10/100/cs

96 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$21.62                   
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.88 $22.54 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.35                            
10/100/cs

$21.50                
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid$51.66 $36.20        
1000/cs

No Bid $40.99                   
1000/cs

Central Poly 
Bag Corp. 
Linden, NJ

1
Apron-Cooking Disposable-
Plastic White, one size fits 
all

96 cs

Bid #15-019
Janitorial Supplies for the County of El Paso

Bid Opening Date: May 18, 2015

Interboro 
Packaging 

Montgomery, NY

$42.22 $36.95
1000/cs

$40.07                   
1000/cs

No BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$33.17
100 bg 

10 bg/cs
No Bid No Bid

All American 
Poly 

Piscataway, NJ

Champion 
Chemical Co. 
Whittler, CA

Boritex Inc.
Arlington, TX

ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc.

Waco, TX

ePoly Star Inc. 
San Leandro, CA

Global Supply USA 
El Cerrito, CA

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $50.16 

Ecolab Inc. 
St. Paul, MN

Pyramid School 
Products

Tampa,  FL                

Wallace 
Packaging, LLC

Tucson, AZ
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Brady 
Industries 

El Paso, TX

Inter. Laundry 
Services Inc 
El Paso, TX

Laun-Dry 
Supply Co. 

Inc.
El Paso, TX

South-
western Mill 

Dist
El Paso, TX

Spectrum 
Paper Co., 

Inc. 
El Paso, TX

Sun 
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El Paso, TX

# Description Est. Qt. Cost
Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref

19 Cafeteria-Surgical 
Face Mask Blue 30/bx 80 bx No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.56 $3.68 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid

20 Cleaner-Glass-Aerosol-
18 oz. 12/cs

20 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $20.34                   
12/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.64 
12/cs

$36.71 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.95                 
12/cs

No Bid $27.98
12/cs $28.82 $24.95                   

12/cs
$19.56               
12/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$25.09 $50.89

2-90ct tubs/cs 

$.1393
  400/cs 
$.1272

$53.36 $34.12 $22.45 $20.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid

100/cs 
$.5336

  50/cs 
$.6824

   72/cs
$.3118

72/cs 
$.2881

$54.52 $23.86 $16.78 $16.76

100/cs 
$.5452

50/cs
 $.4772     48/cs 48/cs 

$.3491

$53.36 $39.95 $39.84

100/cs 
$.5336

400/cs
 $.0998

400/cs
 $.0996

25 Cleaner-Ajax-
w/Chlorine 21 oz. 

30 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.77                            
24/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $65.60 $67.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.25         
24/cs

No Bid $24.98        
24/cs

$25.73 $14.95                                  
24/cs

$15.75                  
24/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

26

Cleaner-Harvard 
Chemical-1530 Pink 
Pot & Pan Detergent 
Concentrated 4 gal/cs

50 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$18.57                     

4/cs No Bid No Bid
$28.66 

4/cs $29.52
$35.88 

4/cs $36.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$23.98                

4/cs
$16.55                              

4/cs No Bid No Bid
$15.88                               

4/cs
$16.59             

4/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

27

Cleaner-Advanced 
Formula Laundry 
Detergent ST-1044 72 
X 2 fl. oz. per case

800 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.70 
4/CS

$28.53

$80.50 
250/CS 
1.2 oz 
$.322

$82.92 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$24.49 
72/cs 
$.340

$24.59                     
72/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

29 Cup Coffee-Styrofoam 
12 OZ. 

250 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.90                   
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23.89                  
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.87                           
1000/cs

$24.06                
1000/cs

$17.50           
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid

30 Cup-Coffee-Styrofoam-
10 oz. 200 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$21.96                          
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$21.99                   
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$20.47                            
1000/cs

$20.80              
1000/cs

$15.50           
1000/cs No Bid No Bid

31 Cup-Styrofoam-8 oz. 220 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.92                                    
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.88                  
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.30                         
1000/cs

$15.59            
1000/cs

$13.50             
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid

32

Cup-Dixie-4 oz.-Paper 
Water Cup  May be 
recycled material that 
withstands hot/cold 

24 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$28.91              
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$48.00              
5000/cs

$41.25           
5000/cs No Bid No Bid

33 Dispenser-Napkin-
7"x3" 60 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.05/cs        
10,000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$23.80                                     
10,000/cs

$22.25          
10,000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

34
Cafeteria Gloves-Non 
Sterile Vinyl Medium 
100/bx

400 bx No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 $25.80 $26.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.56 $1.98 $2.04
$2.03

No Bid $2.34 $2.39 $2.12 $2.02 No Bid $2.15 
box/100 $2.22 

Cleaner-Powdered 
Detergent Disinfectant-
ST-803A 
Equivalent/Better 

No Bid No Bid

No Bid 

No Bid 

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No BidNo Bid            

All American 
Poly 

Piscataway, NJ

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Central Poly 
Bag Corp. 
Linden, NJ

No Bid No Bid28 Coffee-Stirrers 
(plastic)  1000/bx 30 bx

21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid90 cs No Bid

$11.90

ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc.

Waco, TX

Interboro 
Packaging 

Montgomery, NY

Pyramid School 
Products

Tampa,  FL                

Wallace 
Packaging, LLC

Tucson, AZ

Global Supply USA 
El Cerrito, CA

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$25.84

No Bid

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

Champion 
Chemical Co. 
Whittler, CA

ePoly Star Inc. 
San Leandro, CA

No Bid

Ecolab Inc. 
St. Paul, MN

Boritex Inc.
Arlington, TX

No BidNo Bid

$11.05 1/1000  
$1.11 1000/bx          No Bid

No Bid

$1.17                         
1000/bx No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

$51.50                       
400/cs

No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid

$51.32$49.83

22

Cleaner-Neutral 
Cleaner Concentrate 
ST-709 Equivalent or 
Better

120 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.96

23
Cleaner-Glass-
Concentrated ST-840; 
48/2 Fluid oz. pouches 
p/case

700 cs No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid$56.16

No Bid No Bid No Bid $54.96 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid160 cs

Cleaner-Neutral 
Cleaner-Water Flakes 
ST-800--400 X 0.5 wt. 
oz. per pail

24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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Brady 
Industries 

El Paso, TX

Inter. Laundry 
Services Inc 
El Paso, TX

Laun-Dry 
Supply Co. 

Inc.
El Paso, TX

South-
western Mill 

Dist
El Paso, TX
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Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost

Local 
Pref Cost
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Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref Cost Cost Cost Cost 

Local 
Pref

35 Cafeteria Gloves-Non 
Sterile Vinyl Large  100/bx 405 bx No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 $25.80 $26.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.56 $1.98 $2.04 $2.03
 No Bid $2.34 $2.39 $2.12 $2.02 No Bid $2.15 

bx/100 $2.22 

36
Cafeteria Gloves-Non 
Sterile Vinyl Extra 
Large 100/bx 

405 bx No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.13 
$25.80        
10/cs $26.57 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.49 $2.56 $1.98 $2.04 $2.03
 No Bid $2.34 $2.39 $2.12 $2.02 No Bid $2.15

 box/100 $2.22 

a) $21.24  a) $21.88
b) $14.48  b) $14.92
c) $21.24  c) $21.88
d) $21.24  d) $21.88
e) $21.24 e) $21.88

a) $24.70  a) $25.45
b) $22.48  b) $22.51
c) $20.68 c) $21.30
d) $18.32 d) $18.87
e) $18.32 e) $18.87

a) $24.84 a) $25.59

b) $19.72  b) $20.32

a) $22.84 a) $23.53

b) $14.74  b) $15.19

a) $ 25.24 a) $26.00

b) $19.84 b) $20.44

a) $20.70  a) $21.33
b) $19.40 b) $19.99
c) $16.98 c) $17.49

d) $16.98  d) $17.49
e) $16.98 e) $17.49

a) $30.34  a) $31.25

b) $23.98 b) $24.70

c) $19.82 $20.41

d) $16.34  d) $16.83

e) $12.98 e) $13.37

44 Mop Head-Rayon 
Double Stitched 24oz 6 No Bid No Bid

$44.88       
dz $46.23 

$51.93                              
12/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$48.90
12/cs No Bid

$46.68          
12/cs $48.08

$52.20                                      
12/cs

$36.40                   
12/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

45
Pad-Floor Polisher-20" 
Diameter Black-
Stripping

35 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$11.64                                 

5 pds/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$13.20 

5 pds/cs No Bid
$11.09           
5pds/cs $11.43

$11.28                                     
5/cs

$11.20                  
5/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

46
Pad-Floor Polisher-20" 
Diameter Green 
Scrubbing

35 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.64                                 
5 pds/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.20
5 pds/cs

No Bid $11.09           
5pds/cs

$11.43 $11.28                                     
5/cs

$11.20                  
5/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

47
Pad-Floor Polisher-20" 
Diameter Red-
Scrubbing

35 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.64                                 
5 pds/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.20 
5 pds/cs

No Bid $11.09           
5pds/cs

$11.43 $11.28                                     
5/cs

$11.20                  
5/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

48
Pad-Floor Polisher-20" 
Diameter White 
Natural Finish

45 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.64                                 
5 pds/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.20          5 
pds/cs

No Bid $11.09           
5pds/cs

$11.43 $11.28                                     
5/cs

$11.20                  
5/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

43
Liners-Large-Black-38 
X 60 Super Heavy 
Duty 2 Mil.

1100 cs

$19.88

200 cs

No Bid

$13.80 
1000/cs

No Bid$20.42

$21.26                  
100/cs

$19.82            
100/cs

$19.30          
500/cs

$26.77
8/25cs                      

$27.74 
20/25cs

$33.35                   
20/50/cs
$16.98           
10/25

$27.84                     
8/25

$31.84                
5/20

$17.82                                   
500/cs

$14.25                
250/cs 

$25.25 
20/50

$20.50         
100/cs $21.12

$14.80                      
1000/cs

No Bid

No Bid

$19.95
200/cs

No Bid

$57.42       
200/cs

$21.90 
1000/cs

$20.00 
200/cs

$21.90 
1000/cs

Boritex Inc.
Arlington, TX

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
$23.70
200/cs

$22.50                             
200/cs

$22.50                             
500/cs

No Bid

$19.84                    
500/cs

$13.75                  
1000/cs

$19.56                              
1000/cs

Liners-Large-Clear-38 
X 60 52 Microns
.

900 cs

39
Liner Trash Bag 23x100x30-
(11 Micron) High Density 
"Heavy Duty"   33 gal.cap. 
(Beige-Brown-Clear)

250 cs
$27.48                  
250/cs

38

Liner-Trash Bag-
22x16x58-(16 Micron) 
High Density "Extra 
Heavy Duty"  55 gal 
Cap. (clear)

No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid$14.21

Ecolab Inc. 
St. Paul, MN

$29.10                
200/cs $29.98 

$18.90 
200/cs $19.47

No Bid No Bid

No Bid
$23.82                         
200/cs

$24.68

$21.90 
$27.60
100/cs

$27.55
200/cs $28.38 

41 Liners-Medium-Clear-
33 X 40 11 Microns 1100 cs

40 Liners-Small-Clear-24 
X 33 8 Microns

2200 cs $23.74           
500/cs

42 $29.97

$23.95
500/cs

No Bid
$29.10            
100/cs

$27.03                 
500/cs $27.84 

$23.96         
1000/cs
$26.00                    
500/cs $26.78

$28.38
$27.55         
200/cs

$28.31
$23.95
500/cs

$24.46 $16.53 
1000/cs

No Bid

No Bid

b,c,d=200/cs

$59.14 

a,b.c,d,e=100/cs

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$19.56                     
1000/cs

$16.75              
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$17.82                                   
500/cs

No Bid

No Bid

$24.40
 500/cs

$19.10                       
200/cs

$17.49          
200/cs

No Bid

No Bid

$15.90                            
200/cs

$14.71                        
200/cs

No Bid

$22.70 
100/cs

$18.88          
100/cs No BidNo Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$24.40 
500/cs

No Bid

$15.85              
200/cs

$30.40
100/cs

$29.50   
100/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

b,c,d,e = 200/cs

No Bid

All American 
Poly 

Piscataway, NJ

Central Poly 
Bag Corp. 
Linden, NJ

Champion 
Chemical Co. 
Whittler, CA

ePoly Star Inc. 
San Leandro, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc.

Waco, TX

Interboro 
Packaging 

Montgomery, NY

Pyramid School 
Products

Tampa,  FL                

Wallace 
Packaging, LLC

Tucson, AZ

$27.48            
250/cs $28.31

No Bid No Bid

b,c,d,e=1000/cs

37

Liner-Trash Bag-
15x9x32--(8 Micron) 
High Density "Heavy 
Duty"  15 gal. cap. 
(clear)

200 cs
$23.02                       
500/cs $23.71 

$14.44              
1000/cs No Bid

$25.26                 
1000/cs $26.02 

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

Global Supply USA 
El Cerrito, CA

No Bid

$43.96 $45.28 

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

19.32                  
1000/cs

No BidNo Bid

No Bid

$20.40                     
100/cs $21.01 

$17.80        
500/cs $18.33

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$19.90 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid$13.60$13.20
1000/cs

No BidNo Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No BidNo Bid

No Bid
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Brady 
Industries 

El Paso, TX

Inter. Laundry 
Services Inc 
El Paso, TX

Laun-Dry 
Supply Co. 

Inc.
El Paso, TX

South-
western Mill 

Dist
El Paso, TX

Spectrum 
Paper Co., 

Inc. 
El Paso, TX

Sun 
Plastics, Inc. 
El Paso, TX

# Description Est. Qt. Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Cost Cost Local 
Pref

49 Pads-Sanitary Napkin-
Regular

700 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.49                   
250/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.00 $14.42 $16.12 
250/cs

$16.60 No Bid No Bid $32.92
250/cs

No Bid $28.98
250/cs

$29.85 $24.50                    
250/cs

$27.40          
250/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

50
Pad-Scouring-
Synthetic 6 X 9  
(Green Nylon)

80 cs No Bid No Bid $20.17         
6/10cs

$20.78 $10.84                   
60/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $4.98
20/cs

No Bid $10.05                            
60/cs

$10.36 $12.85                          
60/cs

$10.28              
60/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

51
Paper-Drinking 
Straws/Wrapped-
Jumbo

96 bxs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $32.53                    
12000/bx

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.89
500/bx

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.62                  
500/bx

No Bid No Bid No Bid

52 Paper-Butcher-18 X 
1000

42 ea No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.16/rl No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.53/rl   No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.65/rl $17.50/rl No Bid No Bid No Bid

53
Plates-3 Compartment-
Styrofoam 10 1/4"--1" 
Deep

600 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.83              
500/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $29.70
540/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.00                            
500/cs

$12.96              
500/cs

No Bid No Bid

54
Plates-3 Compartment-
Styrofoam with lid 9 
1/8x9 1/8-3" Deep

800 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.44                      
150/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.05
150/cs

$14.02       
150/cs

No Bid No Bid $14.45                        
200/cs

$14.78               
200/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

55
Plates-3 Compartment-
Styrofoam 9 1/4 X 9 
1/4--3" Deep

510 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$13.51                                
500/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.82               
500/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$13.50                          
500/cs

$11.96                  
500/cs No Bid No Bid

56 Plate-Dessert-
Styrofoam 6" 15 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.20                                      
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.82      
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.69             
1000/cs

$16.70                   
1000/cs No Bid No Bid

57
Plates-3 Compartment-
Styrofoam w/lid 9 1/4 X 
9 1/4-- 3" Deep

100 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$16.25                       
150/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.05     
150/cs

$14.02           
150/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$16.22             
200/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

58 Silverware-Fork-Plastic-
Dinner--1000/cs

65 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.91                         
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $21.68 
1000/cs

$22.33 No Bid No Bid $6.50        
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $6.05                      
1000/cs

$6.29            
1000/cs

No Bid $7.00             
1000/cs

$7.21

59
Silverware-Knife-
Dinner-Plastic--
1000/cs

 65 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5.91                         

1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$21.68 
1000/cs $22.33 No Bid No Bid

$6.50        
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$6.05                      
1000/cs

$5.99                  
1000/cs No Bid 

$7.00             
1000/cs $7.21

60
Silverware-Spoon-
Plastic-Dinner--
1000/cs

140 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5.91                         

1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$21.68 
1000/cs $22.33 No Bid No Bid

$6.50        
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$6.05                      
1000/cs

$6.20                 
1000/cs No Bid 

$7.00             
1000/cs $7.21

61
Soap-Cold Cream 
(Pink or White) 3 oz. 
Bars-Wrapped-144/cs

100 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$28.55 

100 $29.41
$19.42 
72/cs $20.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$48.00                                     
144/s No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

62 Soap-Guest-Cashmere-
1/2 oz. Wrapped White 120 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$45.00 
1000 $46.35

$36.88 
1000 $37.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$42.00                   
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

63

Soap-Pumice Bar-
Regular Size Wrapped 
Lava or Equivalent--4 
oz.

110 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $18.07                     
12/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.25
 100

$48.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47.80                     
48/cs

No Bid $41.09           
48/cs

$42.33 $47.50                              
48/cs

$41.28                      
48/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

64 Spoon Soup-1000/cs 120 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$5.91                         

1000/cs $9.02 $9.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$6.50               

1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid
$6.05                        

1000/cs
$6.20                  

1000/cs
$6.95                 

1000/cs
$7.00             

1000/cs $7.21

Boritex Inc.
Arlington, TX

Champion 
Chemical Co. 
Whittler, CA

ePoly Star Inc. 
San Leandro, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc.

Waco, TX

All American 
Poly 

Piscataway, NJ

Central Poly 
Bag Corp. 
Linden, NJ

Wallace 
Packaging, LLC

Tucson, AZ

Interboro 
Packaging 

Montgomery, NY

Pyramid School 
Products

Tampa,  FL                

Global Supply USA 
El Cerrito, CA

Ecolab Inc. 
St. Paul, MN



Page 5

Brady 
Industries 

El Paso, TX

Inter. Laundry 
Services Inc 
El Paso, TX

Laun-Dry 
Supply Co. 

Inc.
El Paso, TX

South-
western Mill 

Dist
El Paso, TX

Spectrum 
Paper Co., 

Inc. 
El Paso, TX

Sun 
Plastics, Inc. 
El Paso, TX

# Description Est. Qt. Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Cost Local 
Pref

Cost Cost Cost Cost Local 
Pref

65 Spork & Napkin--No 
Salt-

700 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.12            
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.10            
1000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $71.10                         
1000/cs

$15.70              
1000/cs

No Bid $13.00          
1000/cs

$13.39

66 Sporks Only 1400 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$6.33            

1000/cs
$9.02 

1000/cs $9.29 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$21.68 
1000/cs $22.33 No Bid No Bid

$6.37      
1000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$6.39                             
1000/cs

$6.06            
1000/cs

$6.95                  
1000/cs

$6.35            
1000/cs $6.54

67
Tissue-Toilet-
Bathroom 4x4, 500 
shts/rl, 2 ply

3000 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$27.61                 
96/rls

$29.66 
96/cs $30.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$24.82                     
96 rls/cs

$25.04                                    
96 rls/cs   No Bid No Bid

$29.80 
96/cs

$24.90                       
96/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

68
Tissue-Toilet-
Bathroom-4x4, 1000 
shts/rl, single ply

1100 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$28,50            
96/rls

$32.81 
96/cs $33.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$34.95
96 rls/cs

$32.00
96/cs No Bid No Bid

$28.95                                   
96/cs

$35.90                     
96/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

69
Tissue-Toilet-Bathroom  2 
ply-jumbo roll tissue 
9"x1000 

450 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$18.50 
 12/cs

$18.28 
12/cs $18.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$20.80               
12 rls/cs

$18.25 
12/cs No Bid No Bid

$17.95                        
12/cs

$19.00                   
12/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

70 Towel-Paper Single 
Fold-Brown 9 1/4 X 10 

1100 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.61
4000

$13.49 
12/cs

$13.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $17.07        
40000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $13.59                                 
4000/cs

$15.90                        
4000/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

71
Towel Paper-Roll Non-
Perforated 7-7/8" X 
350

450 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $15.89 
12/cs

$14.94 
12/cs

$15.39 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.18     
12 rls/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.65
12/cs

$14.90           
12/cs

No Bid No Bid No Bid

72
Towel-Paper  Multifold-
Brown 9 1/4x 9 1/2  500 cs No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$14.78
4000 

$13.54 
4000/cs $13.95 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.57
4000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

$12.98                                            
4000/cs

$14.34
4000/cs No Bid No Bid No Bid

a) $15.25 
b) $14.07

a,b, =4000/cs

Approved By (Signature) Approved By (Print)

73
Towel-Paper-Multi 
Fold-White 9 1/4 X 9 
1/2  

500 cs

DateRecommendation

All American 
Poly 

Piscataway, NJ

Boritex Inc.
Arlington, TX

Central Poly 
Bag Corp. 
Linden, NJ

Champion 
Chemical Co. 
Whittler, CA

Ecolab Inc. 
St. Paul, MN

ePoly Star Inc. 
San Leandro, CA

Global Supply USA 
El Cerrito, CA

ICS Jail Supplies, 
Inc.

Waco, TX

Interboro 
Packaging 

Montgomery, NY

Pyramid School 
Products

Tampa,  FL                

Wallace 
Packaging, LLC

Tucson, AZ

No Bid
$14.88 
4000/csNo Bid

$15.78
4000 $15.33 No BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid

$18.07
4000/csNo BidNo Bid

$15.50 
m/csNo Bid No Bid No Bid No BidNo Bid No BidNo BidNo Bid No Bid No Bid

$15.35                     
4000/cs No BidNo BidNo Bid
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