Bid # 15-050
Vehicles for the Sheriff's Department
Opening Date: October 28, 2015

Rudolp evrole
a Forao epb e Fora
B BOARD CO RA #430
Paso ep e
Paso pee Fo pee
Year/ Year/ 3% Local Year/ Year/ 3% Local
Description | Color | Qty | Make/ Unit Cost | Delivery Make/ Unit Cost 0 Delivery Make/ Unit Cost |Delivery Make/ Unit Cost 0 Delivery
Preference Preference
Model Model Model Model
2016 2016
white | 2 | Ford | $18.661.74 | 8adays | Ford | $1861850 | $19177.06 | B4 206 Chevl ¢r1500.00 | 60 days [ 2216 FO' | s18,376.00| $18.927.28 | 90 days
. ) days Malibu Fusion S
Fusion Fusion S
- 2016 2016
Midsize | glack | 2 | Ford | $18661.74 | 8adays | Ford | 1861850 | $19,177.06 | 8498 P2016Chevl o1 590.00 | 60 days l 2026 7O | $18,376.00| $18,927.28 | 90 days
Sedans . ) days Malibu Fusion S
Fusion Fusion S
2016 2016
Dark 1y | Eord | s18.661.74 | 8adays | Ford | $19,118.50 | $19,692.06 | 8498 2016 Chevl o1 590.00 | 60 days [ 2226 FO' | s18,376.00| $18.927.28 | 90 days
Blue . . days Malibu Fusion S
Fusion Fusion S
2016, Full Size, 2016 Ford
Pick-Up Truck, F-250
% Ton, Extended 2016 Super Cab
Cab, 4x4 with . 4X4 wi6 84-98 2016 Chev 2016 Ford
Six (6) White | 1 Ford $48,652.22 | 84 days Compartm $47,726.00 | $49,157.78 days 2500 HD $48,176.00 | 90 days F-Series $44,140.20 | $45,464.41 | 120 days
Compartment F-250 ent Animal
Camper for Control
Animal Control Slide in
or
) Charcoa Ford Police 8498 2016
Police IGrey | 1 | Explorer | $28,611.74 | 84 days [ Interceptor| $27,393.50 | $28,215.31 d No Bid No Bid No Bid Interceptor | $26,664.30 | $27,464.23 | 90 days
Interceptor | Mmetallic Police Utility ays S0,
Utility (SUV) i AW
AWD Patrol |- oon Ford Police 84-98 2016
Vehicles . 1 $28,611.74 | 84 days | Interceptor| $27,393.50 | $28,215.31 No Bid No Bid No Bid Interceptor | $26,664.30 | $27,464.23 | 90 days
Metallic Explorer Utility days SUV
Poli
2016 2016
Mid-Size suv | M) 1 | eorg | s085587.74 | sadays | 7O | s28546.50 | $20.402.00 | B498 P06 Chevl o0 021.00 | 60 days [ 2°%C FO'| g6 508.00| $27,303.24 | 90 days
Blue Explorer days Traverse Explorer Int
Explorer
4wd
Note:
Silsbee Ford: An Administrative fee of $400.00 will be added.
Approved By (Signature) Approved By (print) Date revised-11/20/2015-ec
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